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Lisa Peacock, Health Offi-
cer for the Health Depart-
ment of  Northwest Michigan,
served her resignation to the
Board of  Health on Tuesday,
February 22, 2022. Although
at the board’s discretion, per
her contract, Peacock is giv-
ing the board a 60-day notice
with her resignation effective
April 29.

In her resignation letter
she cited the “hostile work
environment” and lack of
support by some members of
the Board of  Health.

“One of  my top priorities
in my Health Officer role has

been to maintain the culture
of  excellence and innovation
that the Health Department
of  Northwest Michigan has

been known for over the past
90 years,” Peacock wrote in
her letter to the Board of
Health. “The employees are
motivated to do this work be-
cause they are truly dedi-
cated to serving the
community and they also
know that they are valued
and supported by the organi-
zation’s leadership. While by
no means is our leadership
team perfect, we understand
that people function at their
highest level when they are
supported, valued, trained,
and have the tools they need
to be successful at their job.

The disconnect between this
long-standing culture and the
current Board of  Health is
both striking and damaging.
It is literally impossible for
me to continue to support
our team in this way in the
face of  ongoing efforts by the
Board of  Health to damage
this strong health depart-
ment and me as its leader.”

The Health Department of
Northwest Michigan Board
of  Health is comprised of  two
county commissioners ap-
pointed by their respective
County Boards of  Commis-
sions in Antrim, Charlevoix,

Emmet, and Otsego counties.
Peacock has more than 28

years of  experience in
healthcare, the last 12 of
those at the Health Depart-
ment of  Northwest Michigan
and has served as a Health
Officer since July 2015. Dur-
ing her tenure she has led the
90-year-old agency to effec-
tively and efficiently meet
community needs identified
through regional assessment
and planning. In addition,
among other highlights, she

Health Department Officer Peacock resigns effective April 29

See Resignation–Page 6A

Health Officer Lisa Peacock

BY TINA SUNDELIUS
Charlevoix - Local busi-

nesses and individuals were
recognized for outstanding
contributions to the com-
munity at the 2022
Charlevoix Chamber
Awards Banquet Thursday,
February 24 at Castle
Farms.

The event that was cele-
brated virtually last year
began with a recap of  the
2020 award recipients, an
update of  Chamber activi-
ties and recognition of
board members and Cham-
ber Ambassadors. Guest
speaker Craig Boss, MD
shared his personal and
comedic journey home to
Charlevoix and paralleled a
family slogan, “LNF”,
Leader Not a Follower, with
the community.
“Charlevoix epitomizes
Leader Not a Follower. I
think that phrase is lived
out with all the people
who’ve won awards here,”

he said.  After his speech,
Boss called each award re-
cipient by name and per-
sonally congratulated them
on their success. “It’s pas-
sion that develops success,
it’s not a job,” he said. “If
you keep passion at the
core always, Charlevoix will
always be a leader not a fol-
lower.”

The Charlevoix Area
Chamber of  Commerce ex-
ists to support commerce
and provide leadership to
their membership. They
have over 400 businesses,
organizations, and individ-
ual members. They recog-
nize members who have
gone above and beyond
each year. 

The Charlevoix Area Chamber 
of Commerce Awards Banquet

2021 Chamber Award Winners: New Business of the Year winner David Meikle owner of The Back Lot Charlevoix, Business of the Year winners Jeff Steffey
and his crew from Central Drug Store, Outstanding Citizen of the Year David Miles, Customer Service Award winner Lorraine Niswander, Peggy Kusina
accepting for Tourism Excellence Award winners Linda and Richard Mueller of Castle Farms and Lucky Ducks and Young Professional of the Year winner
Amber Parsons. Not pictured: Chamber Ambassador of the Year Carrie Titus, Edward Jones Financial Advisor.

John Haggard of Haggard’s Plumbing
and Heating was awarded for 50
years of Chamber membership.

Charlevoix Chamber of Commerce members came together to recognize community award winners at the Castle last
weekend.

The Jordan Art Walk Com-
mittee is proud to announce
that the Art Walk’s official
website has been launched.
After two months of  work on
building and creating an in-
formative, user-friendly and
colorful site, the Jordanart-
walk.org website went live on
February 22nd. The seven
member Jordan Art Walk
Committee obtained a grant
from the Charlevoix County
Community Foundation to
help with the website, an
“Artist In Residence” Pro-
gram currently underway
with the East Jordan Middle
High School Welding Class,
Instructor Dave Muladore
and sculptor Ann Gildner
and funding of  the platform
CAFÉ to assist with their
Call to Artist. The committee
is planning on adding six to
seven additional sculptures
to the Jordan Art Walk
which debuted in 2020. A ded-
ication and ribbon cutting
ceremony will take place
June 15th, 10:30 AM, begin-
ning in Memorial Park and
the bandshell. Ribbon Cut-
tings will take place at each
of  the new sculptures being
added this year by the artists
and their sponsors. Sponsor-
ship opportunities are cur-
rently available. For more
information on the Jordan
Art Walk, contact Mary at
the East Jordan Area Cham-
ber of  Commerce at 231-536-
7351 or info@ejchamber.org.
The Jordan Art Walk is a col-
laboration of  the Jordan
River Arts Council, City of
East Jordan, Friends of  the
Jordan River and Active Re-
covery Physical Therapy.
Committee members include:
Rich Dietrich, Babs Young,
Nancy Carey, John Hunter,
Tom Cannon, Jaleesa O’Neal
and Mary Faculak.

Jordan Art Walk
Website Launched



(Date night can 
be inexpensive
and fun)

Dear Dave,
We’re trying to get control

of  our finances by living on a

budget. We also have about
$18,000 in debt we are trying
to pay off. My husband
brings home $3,400 a month,
and I am currently taking
care of  our eight-month-old
baby. We would like to have a
date night once a month, and
he thinks we should set aside
$200 for this. Under the cur-
rent circumstances, I feel like

this is too much. What do you
think?

Carolyne

Dear Carolyne,
If  you’d told me you guys

make $150,000 a year, I’d say
go have a great time. But
with your income, and a lot
of  debt on top, I’d put the
brakes on that amount. It
sounds like he’s looking for
an outlet to unwind and have
a little fun, without giving a
lot of  thought to the big pic-
ture. The good thing, though,
is you’re working together
and beginning to take this
personal finance thing seri-
ously.

My advice would be to
lower the date night amount
to about $50 right now. That’s
plenty for a reasonable din-

ner and a babysitter for a
couple of  hours. You might
not have to figure babysitting
expenses into the equation at
all if  you have family or
friends nearby.

Going out on a date doesn’t
have to mean spending a lot
of  money. Years ago, when
my wife and I were broke, we
did tons of  stuff that didn’t
cost a dime. Things like hik-
ing and picnics are great
ways to spend quality time
together, while keeping your
pocketbook in your pocket.
Just be creative, talk about it
together and make sure you
find ways to have a little us
time on a regular basis.

I think you’re right on this
one, Carolyne!

— Dave

Rose Marie Jernberg, 81
(APRIL 5, 1940 – FEB. 25, 2022)

Rose M. Jernberg died on
Friday, February 25, 2022, at
the home of  her daughter in
Wilson Township,
Charlevoix County, Michi-
gan.

She was born on April 5,
1940, in Fostoria, Ohio.  

Rose was a member of  the
American Legion Auxiliary
in Grayling, the Eagles in
Grayling and had volun-
teered at the food Pantry in
Grayling. 

She is survived by five
children, Charles R. Knop of
East Jordan, William C.
Knop of  Fairbanks, Alaska,
Vivian M. Knop of  Cordova,
Alaska, Carl L. (Nicole)
Knop of  Oakhurst, New Jer-
sey and Katharine S. (Bret)
Roehrig of  Boyne City; five
grandchildren, Carrie A.
(Kyle) White of  Mt. Pleas-
ant, Kayla Knop of
Oakhurst, New Jersey,
Alyssa Knop of  Oakhurst,
New Jersey, John Roehrig of
Boyne City and Nolan
Roehrig of  Boyne City; two
great granddaughters,
Katherine White and Piper
White; one brother, Johnny
(Linda) Gingerick of  Bay
City; two sisters, Sarah
(Carl) Beck of  Roscommon
and June (Earl) Griffith of
Grayling; as well as several
nieces and nephews.  She
was preceded in death by

her husband of  forty years,
David Jernberg; parents, Vi-
vian and Clyde Koch.

A memorial service will
be held on Saturday, March
5, 2022, at 11:00 A.M. at
Christ Lutheran Church,
Boyne City.  The family will
receive friends on Saturday
from 10:00 A.M. until service
time. 

Memorial contributions
may be directed to McLaren
Hospice, One Hiland Cot-
tage, Petoskey, MI 49770 or
Christ Lutheran Church,
1250 Boyne Avenue, Boyne
City, MI 49712.  The family
was served by the Penzien
Funeral Homes, Inc., East
Jordan. 

Judge Daniel F. 
Walsh, 91

(OCT. 28, 1930 - FEB. 19, 2022)

Daniel Francis Walsh died
on February 19, 2022, at his
home in Savannah, Georgia. 

Judge Walsh was born on
October 28, 1930, in Detroit,
Michigan to Francis and
Eileen Walsh. He was the
third of  five children and
preceded by all in death. He
is also predeceased by a
granddaughter, Mary-
Katherine Sogan Bauer and
step-grandson, Joshua Lee
LaCrosse. He is survived by

his wife of  62 years, Carol,
six children, Michael
(Linda), Elizabeth (David),
Patricia (William), Thomas
(Kerri), Timothy (Erin), and
William (Ninette), foster
daughter Susan, 15 grand-
children, and two great-
grandchildren. 

Judge Walsh was educated
at Sacred Heart Seminary in
Detroit, Michigan, and grad-
uated second in his class in
1952. He pursued graduate
studies in theology and
canon law at St. John’s
Provincial Seminary in Ply-
mouth, Michigan. Then,
after opting not to be or-
dained, obtained his Juris
Doctor from the University
of  Detroit in 1958, where he
was inducted in Alpha
Sigma Nu, the National Je-
suit Honor Society. While in
seminary he began a lifelong
association with Camp
Sancta Maria as a camper,
counselor, head counselor,
and longtime board member.

Judge Walsh ascended to
the judiciary in 1969, serving
as a judge on the 87th Judi-
cial District of  Michigan and
the 46th Judicial Circuit of
Michigan. He then served as
a judge on the Michigan
Court of  Appeals from 1975
to 1988. As State Court Ad-
ministrator, he was re-
quested by the Supreme
Court in 1983 to temporarily
take over the administration
of  the State trial courts and
devise procedures to im-
prove the Michigan court
systems. His venerable repu-
tation was such that follow-
ing Justice Antonin Scalia’s
appointment to the Supreme
Court in 1986, Judge Walsh
was asked by the United
States Attorney General’s
office to submit himself  for
consideration to replace Jus-
tice Scalia on the Court of
Appeals for the District of
Columbia. 

In addition to his many
professional associations
and activities, which in-
cluded memberships on the
Michigan Judges Associa-
tion Executive Committee,
the State Bar of  Michigan
Judicial Conference, and
Michigan Judicial Council,
Judge Walsh was also a pro-
lific and devoted civic ser-
vant. He was most
particularly involved with
the Catholic Church and
Catholic education in the
state of  Michigan. He was a
member of  the Diocesan
Board of  Education in
Grand Rapids, Michigan,
and president of  the Board
of  Christian Education and
St. Mary’s School Board in
Gaylord, Michigan. He was
also deeply involved with Ot-
sego Memorial Hospital,
serving as president of  the
board of  directors and sen-
ior vice president of  the Ot-
sego Memorial Hospital
Foundation.

Judge Walsh retired early

from an auspicious career at
age 58, choosing instead to
devote his time to his cher-
ished wife Carol, his chil-
dren, and grandchildren.
The Walsh’s began spending
time in their beloved Savan-
nah, Georgia in 1989, where
he continued to support his
family and causes. 

A public servant and pil-
lar of  the community for all
his life, Judge Walsh was
recognized for his distin-
guished judicial career and
civic-mindedness. Among
his family, he is remembered
for his wisdom, steadfast
moral code, and most of  all
his warmth, generosity, and
playfulness. He applied the
same thoughtful diligence to
his many hobbies and inter-
ests as to every other area of
his life. As an avid cyclist, he
rode his bicycle up to 30
miles every morning. As a
Disney fan, visits to Walt
Disney World became an an-
nual pilgrimage. As a sailor
and golfer, he appreciated
the outdoors with the fervor
of  a transcendentalist, turn-
ing to nature to, “expand my
soul.” He was a lover of  clas-
sic movies and Irish folk
songs, spaghetti with mari-
nara, and vanilla ice cream
with hot fudge. To his chil-
dren and grandchildren, he
imparted his guiding princi-
ples of  humility, duty, and
altruism and they continue
to be always guided by his
example.

A Mass of  Christian Bur-
ial was held for Judge Walsh
at St. Francis Cabrini
Catholic Church, 11500 Mid-
dleground Road, Savannah,
Georgia on Saturday, Febru-
ary 26th, 2022.

In lieu of  flowers, please
send donations to the
Alzheimer’s Foundation by
visiting alz.org

"Dan was one of  the men I
admired most in my lifetime.
He was kind, honest and
supportive of  always doing
the right thing. He was one
of  those people that you
thank God for bringing into
your life. He was a remark-
able man," Dave Baragrey.

Shirley J. Hart, 66
(1955 ~ 2022)

Shirley J. Hart of  East
Jordan died on Sunday, Feb-
ruary 27, 2022 in Petoskey.

A memorial service will
be held on Wednesday,
March 2, 2022, at 11:00 A.M.
at the Lighthouse Mission-
ary Church in East Jordan.

Russell Bolt, 92
(FEB. 28, 1929 – FEB. 24, 2022)

Russell “Russ” Allen Bolt
of  Charlevoix passed away
on Thursday, February 24,
2022.  He was born on Febru-
ary 28, 1929 in Cleveland,
OH, the son of  Elmer and
Hilda (Meyers) Bolt. 

Russ graduated from John
Marshall High School in
Cleveland, and went to at-
tend the Cleveland Institute
of  Art. His schooling was in-
terrupted when he was
drafted into the United
States Marine Corps during
the Korean Conflict. Upon
returning to the institute, he
met Susan Collier, his part-
ner in love and art, the two
wed on November 25, 1954,
in Cleveland.

Russ worked as an auto
designer for GM at the Tech
Center in Warren for 25
years, where safety was one
of  his crusades. He and Sue
moved their family to
Charlevoix in 1974 and
opened Bolt Designs which
remains in business to this
day. Russ was an extremely
gifted artist and designer,
doing free-lance advertising,
as well as specializing in wa-
tercolor painting, and ce-
ramics.  He enjoyed sharing
his love for art by teaching
classes in watercolor. His
work was represented in
many one man shows na-
tionally and internationally.
Russ was an active member
of  the Marine Corps League
and organized many events
for Toys for Tots throughout
the years.  He enjoyed
spending time at his son’s
farm in Atwood, and he
loved his grandchildren
more than anything else.

Russ is survived by his
loving wife, Susan Bolt;
three children, Lori Bolt
(Frank Hasseld) of  East Jor-
dan, Russell Jr. (Cindy) Bolt
of  Atwood, and Robert Bolt
of  Charlevoix; and four
grandchildren, Elizabeth
Hasseld of  Edinburgh, Scot-
land, William Hasseld of
Boyne City, Rusty Bolt of
Petoskey, and Marguerite

Bolt of  Lafayette, IN.
He was preceded in death

by his parents, and two
brothers, Don Bolt and
Kenny Bolt.

A celebration of  Russ’ life
will be held this summer.
Details will be added to his
obituary on the Mortensen
Funeral Homes website once
they are available.

In lieu of  flowers, memo-
rial donations may be made
by checks made payable to
Charlevoix Community
Foundation, with “Russ
Bolt” on the memo line. This
will support the Arts and
Culture Fund.  Mail To: C3F-
Arts and Culture Fund P.O.
Box 718, East Jordan, MI
49727

Arrangements are in the
care of  the Charlevoix
Chapel of  Mortensen Fu-
neral Homes.  Please sign
his online guestbook at
www.mortensenfuneral-
homes.com

Nellie Palazzolo
FEBRUARY 23, 2022

Nellie Palazzolo passed
away on Wednesday, Febru-
ary 23, 2022 in Charlevoix.

Nellie was preceded in
death by her husband An-
toninio “Tony” Palazzolo.
Nellie is survived by her
children Salvatore (Paula)
Palazzolo & Rose Ann Miller,
grandchildren Bryan (Karly)
Miller, Sara (Daniel) Lang-
ham, Stephani (Andy)
Leyva, Matthew Palazzolo &
Alex (Clara) Miller, and
great-grandchildren
Greyson, Hudson & Warren.

A memorial service will
be held in April. Exact date
to be determined.  Details
will be added to Nellie's obit-
uary on the Mortensen Fu-
neral Home website once
determined.

Arrangements are in the
care of  the Charlevoix
Chapel of  Mortensen Fu-
neral Homes.  Please sign
her online guestbook at
www.mortensenfuneral-
homes.com
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The Veteran of
the Month of
March 2022 is
Steven Ivan
Kotowich. 

Born January 12, 1924 to
parents George and Anna
Feidaw Kotowich on the fam-
ily farm south of  East Jor-
dan, at Mr. Bliss.  Steve grew
up on Mount Bliss Road and

attended Mount  Bliss School
in early  elementary,  then to
the East Jordan Public
School through the 8th
grade.  Steve helped on the
family farm until 1941, then
joined the Civilian Conserva-
tion Corp.  While in the CCC
he took a 2 month course in
Radio Transmission and
worked as their Radio opera-
tor.  On January 26, 1943,
Steve enlisted into the United
States Army joining his Sis-
ter Mary, Brothers John and
Ted, during WWII in the Eu-
ropean Theater of  Opera-

tions.  His CCC experience
transferred to the military in
Radio Operations.  He would
operate voice and code trans-
missions, and repair sets that
were broken.  On November
1, 1945, at Fort. Benning
Georgia, Steve received an
Honorable Discharge from

his military service.  Return-
ing home to Mt. Bliss, he
would become a welder by
trade working at the Ship
Yard in Menominee, Michi-
gan, and also had been a
Merchant Marine Seaman on
the Great Lakes for many
years.  Steve was a pilot, and
enjoyed flying his several air-
planes.  One of  which was
the AT 6.  He also had his
own airfield by the family
farm on Mt. Bliss Road, and
designated it as KIA—  Ko-
towich International Air-
port.  Steve was a well known
collector of  knives and guns.
He enjoyed travelling to
Cuba, and the South Pacific.
He always enjoyed sharing
his experiences with friends
when he returned home.  On
March 22, 1982, Steven Ivan
Kotowich answered the final
call and is being honored by
his niece Mary Anne
Smigulec.

STEVEN IVAN 
KOTOWICH.

U. S. MILITARY
VETERAN 
OF THE MONTH

Gaylord - Today, Rep.
Jack Bergman’s bill  was
signed into law, naming the
new Gaylord VA clinic in
honor of  the late Navy
Corpsman Steve An-
drews.  of  this legislation
from the entire Michigan
delegation as well as the
Michigan chapters of  the
VFW, American Legion,
AMVETS, and DAV.

Andrews was a beloved
member of  the Gaylord
community and a state leg-
islator representing the
106th District, having previ-
ously served our Nation
overseas at the U.S. Navy
Hospital in Guam and as a
medic in the 1st Marine Di-
vision and Marine 1st Force
Reconnaissance Company
in Vietnam.

Rep. Bergman
stated, “I’m grateful for the
support of  so many in the
community and across the
state who helped in our ef-
fort to designate the Gay-
lord Community Based
Outpatient Center (CBOC)
in honor of  Steve Andrews,
a lifelong servant to both
his nation and neighbors. I
can say from personal expe-
rience, that Steve was the
type of  leader who did not
hesitate to reach out to
someone he had never met
before and share his
thoughts on what it meant
to be a public servant. With
President Biden signing
this bill into law, I’m confi-
dent Navy Corpsman An-
drews’ legacy will continue
to inspire the Veterans and
VA health staff  throughout
the area in which he had
such an impact for

decades.”
Jim Grisso, publisher of

the Gaylord Herald Times
from 1968 to 2008, praised
Andrews, a Gaylord native,
not only as a distinguished
Vietnam war hero but a de-
voted public servant and
local community leader as
well.

“Personally, I knew
Steve, and his family, very
well. As a newspaper editor
and publisher I followed his
role as a state legislator in
the Michigan House of  Rep-
resentatives. He gave 100%
effort all the time. Steve
also was known for his abil-
ity to deal with others who
sat across the political aisle.
As a business owner in the
Petoskey area, he was very
active and played a leader-
ship role in the community
in many ways. Steve is very
deserving of  this

honor,” said Grisso.

BACKGROUND ON 
CORPSMAN ANDREWS:

Steve Andrews entered
the U.S. Navy in 1967 as a
Hospital Corpsman then
subsequently served at the
U.S. Naval Hospital on
Guam and as a medic with
the 1st Marine Division and
Marine 1st Force Recon-
naissance Company in Viet-
nam. For his actions in
combat in Vietnam and for
saving the lives of  countless
Marines, he was awarded
the Navy Commendation
Medal and received the Pur-
ple Heart.

Following his military
service, Steve worked as an
entrepreneur and was later
elected to the Michigan
House of  Representatives,

representing Northern
Michigan’s 106th District.
Steve served Northern
Michigan for two terms and
then turned his efforts to
building his family and
business. Steve coached and
was a father figure to thou-
sands of  kids in baseball,
football, and more. He addi-
tionally served on the board
of  trustees of  North Cen-
tral Michigan College and
was president of  the
Petoskey Regional Chamber
of  Commerce. ��The new
Gaylord VA Community
Based Outpatient Clinic
(CBOC) located at 2782 S.
Otsego Avenue, officially
opened its doors on Mon-
day, August 24, 2020. The
18,362 square foot CBOC
provides outpatient pri-
mary care, mental health,
telehealth, laboratory serv-
ices, home-based primary
care, women’s health and
whole health.

Just Signed into Law: Bergman Bill to Name 
VA Clinic for Navy Corpsman Steve Andrews 
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Students and families
across Antrim, Charlevoix,
Emmet and Otsego counties
have better access to health
services thanks to school-
based health centers oper-
ated by the Health
Department of  Northwest
Michigan. During February,
the staff and services pro-
vided by these health centers
are celebrated as part of
School Based Health Center
Awareness Month. 

“There have been school-
based or school-linked health
centers in Michigan for over
30 years,” said Cortney
Crocker, a Nurse Practitioner
with the Ironmen Health
Center, operated in collabora-
tion with Mancelona Public
Schools at the Mancelona
Family Resource Center.  

Currently, there are just
over 300 centers and pro-
grams in Michigan and over
2,500 nationwide. Michigan is
among the top six states that
have the largest number of

health centers in the U.S.   
The health impacts of

school-based health centers
are profound. 

“Students have better ac-
cess to health services creat-
ing healthier students and
families,” Crocker said.
“Healthy students learn bet-

ter, the attendance rate in
schools increase, there’s re-
duced emergency room
usage, and parents spend
more time at work because
they are not missing work for
doctor’s appointments,” she
explained. 

The Ironmen Health Cen-

ter provides acute care visits,
preventative health care,
screenings, vaccinations, lab
work, and mental health and
wellness support services. In
addition to the Ironman
Health Center, the Health De-
partment of  Northwest
Michigan, in cooperation
with local public schools op-
erates the Blue Devil Well-
ness Center in Gaylord, the
Hornet Health Center in Pell-
ston, the Ram Wellness Pro-
gram in Harbor Springs, and
the Rambler Wellness Pro-
gram in Boyne City. While
slightly different services are
offered at each location, the
ultimate goal is the same: en-
hance the wellness of  stu-
dents and their families and
communities. 

The Ironmen Health Cen-
ter recently underwent ex-
tensive renovations to
enhance the appearance and
attractiveness of  the facility.
The exam rooms have re-
ceived a fresh coat of  paint,

new growth mindset posters
are located around the cen-
ter, and creative student art-

work lines the halls of  the
wellness center. 

Additionally, the Ironmen
Health Center has an ongo-
ing contest to encourage stu-
dents to get updated on their
preventative health care
services. Students receive a
ticket entry for keeping their
appointments, getting a phys-
ical, participating in the teen
advisory committee, and fol-
lowing the center on Face-
book. Prizes include Super
Sunday tickets and tubing
tickets at Shanty Creek, a gift
card to Paddles and Pedals in
Bellaire, and a gift card to the
Lakes of  the North golf
course.  

Crocker also noted that
Nurse Practitioner Tammy
Hickman retired this sum-
mer after serving 27 years
with the Health Department
of  Northwest Michigan, with
the majority of  the years
spent at the Ironmen Health
Clinic. 

Health Department celebrates School-Based Health Center Awareness Month in February 

Mancelona Public School students Julia Kirby and Emma Moser read in the
newly updated waiting room at the Ironmen Health Center. 

Nurse Practitioner Cortney Crocker
checks Adam Ackler’s reflexes in one
of the freshly painted exam rooms at
the Ironmen Health Center. The Health
Department of Northwest Michigan is
celebrating all of its school-based
health centers during School Based
Health Center Awareness Month in
February. 

BY DAVE BARAGREY
GAYLORD – Gus Macker

Basketball is returning to
Gaylord, June 25, 26, 2022

Gus Macker Tournaments
are designed for basketball
players who love the fun of
the driveway game – male or
female, from age 7 to 70-plus,
short and tall, the most expe-
rienced or those with little or
no experience who just want
to play.

Gaylord first hosted the
Gus Macker tournament in
1991. Then Gaylord Chamber
of  Commerce director, Bill
Wishart, was a basketball fan
and referee and connected
with the McNeal brothers to
bring this popular basketball
tournament to the Alpine Vil-
lage. At the height of  its pop-
ularity the Gaylord Gus
Macker tournament hosted
as many as 5,000 players and
an estimated additional 20,000
fans. Gaylord hosted the Gus
Macker tournament for 15
years until 2006. 

The tournament is coming
back to Gaylord under the di-
rection of  James Vanderveer,
director of  the Otsego County
Sportsplex. Vanderveer is a
long time registered basket-
ball referee and has officiated
state tournament and college
games. The tournament will
be held in the parking lot of
the Sportsplex. Vanderveer
commented, “I am excited to
have Gus Macker return to
Gaylord. A tournament like
this brings a lot of  excitement
to the community and to the
sport of  basketball. This will
inspire young people to enjoy
being outdoors with a basket-
ball in their hand. This a
great wholesome, fun event. I
am thrilled to have it return
to Gaylord.”

This year, 2022, is the 49th
year of  Gus Macker Basket-
ball. For the first 13 years it
was a single tournament
started by a pair of  brothers
and their friends in Lowell,
Mich., in 1974 but became a
festival phenomenon and
America’s Original 3-on-3

Basketball Tour in 1987.
Through the years there

have been almost 1,500 sanc-
tioned Gus Macker Tourna-
ments presented for over
700,000 teams or almost 2.7
million players and played in
front of  almost 28 million
spectators across the country.

Teams are computer-
matched into male and fe-
male divisions in one of  three
categories: Junior, Adult, or
Top. The age, height and ex-
perience of  all four players
on each team are considered
in bracketing. Teams receive
at least three scheduled
games each tournament. Gus
Macker is a double-elimina-
tion tournament, but with a
consolation bracket histori-
cally called “The Toilet Bowl”
for teams that lose the first
two games.

In addition to the economic
impact of  bringing thousands
of  players and fans into the
community, the charitable as-
pect of  the Gus Macker Tour-
nament is very important. At
each tournament site the
local organizing committee
donates proceeds from their
event to a local charity or
charities. Also, in many cities
local non-profit clubs, groups
and organizations raise funds
through on-site food conces-
sion sales, special events and
other on-site activities. The
total amount donated to local
charities by the local commit-
tees has steadily increased
over the past few years. Gus
Macker estimates that since
1987 - approximately $16 mil-
lion has been raised for
worthwhile local charities.

Family fun in a festival at-
mosphere is always the goal
of  a Gus Macker Tourna-
ment, and we proudly serve
as the most popular basket-
ball tournament for outdoor
play in downtown streets,
parking lots and community
parks across the country.

Learn more and register
your team at macker.com.
Online Registration deadline
is June 6.

The Mack is Back
Gus Macker 3 on 3 Basketball tournament
is coming back to Gaylord June 25, 26



PETOSKEY
LIFTED UP IN SONG
The Northern Michigan

Chorale invites you sing
this spring. Join with
members from all over
our northern counties.
Enjoy singing with a joy-
ous community choir of
all ages. No audition re-
quired. We are a friendly
group. Register on-line at
www.nmchorale.org.. Join
us at the Cross of  Christ
church Feb. 21, 28 or
March 7. Monday re-
hearsals at Cross of
Christ Lutheran church,
1400 E. Mitchell (nera
Petoskey High school).
Practices continue each
Monday from 7-9pm. Mask
required. Concert June 11,
12 at Bay Harbor’s Great
Lakes Center for the Arts.
For more info contact Mu-
sic Director, Julie Pier-
pont. 231-622-1893. Enter-
taining you since 1982.

CHARLEVOIX
BUSINESS EXPO
AND TASTE OF
CHARLEVOIX

The Charlevoix Area
Chamber of  Commerce is
excited to host the 10th
Annual Charlevoix Busi-
ness Expo and Taste of
Charlevoix, taking place
at Castle Farms on
Wednesday, March 16 from
4-7:00 pm. General Busi-
ness Expo Vendor: All
booth spaces are $200
each. Taste of  Charlevoix
booth spaces are at no
charge. Registration will
continue to be open to the
membership until all
spaces are filled, but
please note that we must
have your contract and
payment by Friday, Febru-
ary 25. If  you have any
questions, please contact
Caitlin Cole at 231-547-2101
or cole@charlevoix.org. 

EAST JORDAN
EJPS

EXTRAVAGANZA
Fundraiser benefitting

East Jordan Public
Schools Saturday, March 5
at 5:30-11pm at the Boat-
house on Lae Charlevoix.
Tickets are available at
the elementary and mid-
dle/high school offices.
$75 each. Only 200 tickets

will be sold. 

PETOSKEY
SWING DANCE

CLASS
Northern Michigan

Swing Dance lessons in
Petoskey on March 8 and
March 15. 405 E. Lake St.
upstairs in the Masonic
Lodge 6pm-7pm. Dancing
after lesson, instructors:
Mel and Nancy Kiogima.
$8 per person, no registra-
tion, no partner required.
Free lessons, if  you have
not danced with us before,
on March 8 and 15. East
Coast Swing. If  you wish
to not change partners,
your request will be hon-
ored. Call 231-632-5968 if
you have questions. Ball-
room Dance of  Northern
Michigan. Tea Dance on
March 20, 2022

EAST JORDAN
LENTEN INTER-FAITH

PRAYER SERIES
Join fellow Christians of

many denominations as
we come together to
deepen our common faith
in Jesus Christ. Each
Wednesday session begins
at 12:10pm with a prayer
reflection conducted by
the pastoral leader of  the
hosting church. This fol-
lowed by a soup and salad
lunch. A free will offering
will be used to support
Christian outreach efforts
of  the Ministerial associa-
tion.
March 9 - St. Joseph

Catholic Church
March 16 - Lighthouse

Missionary Church
March 23 - First Presby-

terian Church
March 30 - East Jordan

Community Church
April 6 - Evangelical

Lutheran Church
April 15 - Good Friday

Ecumenical Service, 7pm.
East Jordan United
Methodist Church

BOYNE CITY
LIBRARY HISTORY

SERIES
An Historical Review of

our Region. A four-part se-
ries on the history of  the
Boyne City region. Satur-
days starting March 12th,

1pm-3pm, in the Commu-
nity Room of  the Boyne
District Library. Program
by Edward May III. Open-
ing comments by Asuka
Barden. Free and open to
the public. Registration is
required. Call 231-582-7861
or register online. Each
day requires its own regis-
tration. 
Part 1 - March 12th: The

Path to Boyne - A detailed
look into immigration and
the founding families of
Boyne City, MI, pre-1900s.
Part 2 - March 19:

Emerging Industries -
Railroads, industries,
lumber boom and decline,
the birth of  F.O. Barden &
Son.
Part 3 - March 26: Grow-

ing Community - Paternal
clubs, schools, churches,
city councils, trial by ad-
versity ~ perseverance.
Part 4 - April 2: Loving

Living & Passing It On -
For the fun of  it! Fishing,
bowling, golf, football,
barn mountain / ava-
lanche, Smeltania, and the
4th of  July.

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
SNOW REMOVAL
FOR SENIORS

The Charlevoix County
Commission on Aging will
have our Senior Snow Re-
moval Programs available
again this year! Packets
can be picked up curbside
at all of  our Senior Center
Locations or at the COA
offices.

GAYLORD
CONCERT

Chonda Pierce live in
concert 7pm, March 25 at
the E-FREE Church.
Doors open at 6pm. Ticket
prices: VIP: $55. GEN. AD-
MIN.: $29. GEN. ADMIN.
GROUP (10+): $26. VIP
GROUP 10+: $52. Tickets
at
https://www.etix.com/tic
ket/p/6490520/?partner_id
=3086&blm_aid=37459

EAST JORDAN
JORDAN ART WALK
CALL TO ARTISTS
After a sensational first

year debut, the Jordan Art
Walk Committee is
proudly announcing its
2nd Annual “Call to
Artists” for sculpture
with a nature based
theme. The call for appli-
cations will run now
through March 31, 2022.
Artists may submit up to 3
entries digitally on the
CaFE website (callforen-
try.org) or contact the East
Jordan Area Chamber of
Commerce for more infor-
mation. Phone 231-536-7351
or email info@ejcham-
ber.org. 

BELLAIRE
SNOW CHALLENGE
April 2/3 - Schuss Moun-

tain Snow Challenge - 12th
annual

EAST JORDAN
FRIENDS OF THE
JORDAN RIVER
WATERSHED

The 2022 Photo Contest
is open for submissions.
We need more winter pho-
tos for the calendar, brave
the cold and get out into
the winter wonderland of
the Jordan River Water-
shed. Contest details:
www.friendsofthejordan.o
rg

GAYLORD
EASTER CRAFT

SHOW
Plan to attend the

Easter craft and vendor
show on April 2 at Ellison
Place, just off  I-75 exit 279.
Pictures with the Easter
Bunny. Great ideas and
gifts to celebrate Easter.
Go to
Facebook.com/Northern-
MIevents or www.North-
ernMIevents.com

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
2022 SPRING TREE

SALE
Order Deadline: April

15th. Register for a time
slot by April 22nd (for or-
der pick-up). Tree Sale
Weekend (pre-orders
only): April 29th & 30th.
Friday, April 29th 2-5pm,
Saturday, April 30th 9am-
Noon. Order forms are
available to download
from our website home
page (and Tree Sale Link):
www.charlevoixcd.org. 

CHARLEVOIX
SWIM LESSON
SCHOLARSHIPS
AVAILABLE

The Charlevoix Area
Community Pool has a
limited number of  swim
lesson scholarships avail-
able. The scholarships are
for any student residing
in the Charlevoix or
Boyne City school dis-
tricts who qualifies for
free or reduced lunch. The
next set of  lessons start in
February. Scholarships
are available thanks to a
grant from the Charlevoix
County Community Foun-
dation. More info at:
www.charlevoixpool.org 

KALKASKA
TROUT FESTIVAL

April 23 - National Trout
Festival Week-end (Parade
is 23rd)

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
COVID-19
VACCINES

AVAILABLE TO
HOMEBOUND
RESIDENTS

The Health Department
and EMS services in
Charlevoix County have
begun offering Covid-19
vaccinations to the home-
bound population in
Charlevoix County. This
service is intended only
for individuals unable to
travel to an established
vaccine location—the Of-
fice of  Emergency Man-
agement schedules ap-
pointments for home
visits. The Johnson &
Johnson single-dose vacci-
nation shots will be given
during these visits. Please
note that EMS paramedics
will not show up at your
residence in an ambu-
lance but another fully
equipped vehicle. Para-
medics will be prepared to
provide medical service
immediately in the rare
event of  an adverse reac-
tion to the shot. They
would dispatch an ambu-
lance only if  one is needed
for transporting a patient
to the hospital. Persons
who are homebound or
otherwise unable to travel
but want a vaccine are en-
couraged to contact Emer-
gency Management at 231-
541-4461 (Sheriff ’s Dept
Office Line) to schedule
an appointment.

STATEWIDE
TROUT SEASON

April 30, Opening Day
Trout Season

BOYNE CITY
2022 NATIONAL

MOREL MUSHROOM
FESTIVAL 

The National Morel
Mushroom Festival is ex-
tremely pleased to an-
nounce the dates of  our
normal full-scale Festival:
May 12-15, 2022 in beauti-
ful Boyne City, Michigan.
Confirmed Events include
a weekend Craft Show,
Carnival, Friday Wine &
Dine, Saturday Taste of
Morels and evening Con-
cert featuring Detroit’s
award-winning country
rock band The Family
Tradition Band. It’s gonna
be one heck of  a Festival,
so put it in your calendar
now! More events and de-
tails will be announced as
they are confirmed.

EAST JORDAN
HIKE 

Wagbo Farm and Educa-

tion Center is excited to
announce a family-
friendly trail series to get
community members out-
doors and enjoy the win-
ter months. Supported by
a generous gift from
Charlevoix County Com-
munity Foundation (C3F),
the new Stroll & Sip series
offers interactive trail ac-
tivities while hiking, ski-
ing or snowshoeing the
various 1-2 mile loops
through the fields and
forests of  the 212-acre
property. Upcoming hikes
will be the first Sunday of
each month, through May,
from 1 PM to 5PM.

CHARLEVOIX
IGLOO ISLAND

Visit Charlevoix’s New
Igloo Island. Welcome to
Downtown Charlevoix’s
brand new igloo island, lo-
cated at 100 E. Clinton St.
on top of  the Harbormas-
ter building. The igloos
are heated and equipped
with seating for your en-
joyment. They can be re-
served or used on the first
come first served basis
when unoccupied. This
project brought to you by
the Charlevoix High
School Junior Main Street
students and funded by a
grand from the Charlevoix
County Community Foun-
dation.

CHARLEVOIX
PHOTOGRAPHY
CLUB CALENDAR

AVAILABLE
The Best of  the

Charlevoix Photography
Club 2022 Calendar is hot
off  the press today! This
calendar, which is locally
printed, features wonder-
ful photographs from 12
separate club members.
Visit www.Charlevoixpho-
tographyclub.org to place
an order, or visit the
Charlevoix Circle of  Arts
at 109 Clinton St. The sell-
ing price is $25.

CHARLEVOIX
LITTLE WAVES

CHILDREN’S MUSIC
PROGRAM

Music Program is of-
fered by the Great Lakes
Chamber orchestra and
hosted each month by
Charlevoix Public Library
and Petoskey District Li-
brary.  Free and open to
the public the program is
designed to introduce
young children (ages 4 -
10) and their families to
music in an entertaining
setting.  Each event takes
place on the second Satur-
day of  each month. The
theme for 2022 is “My Fa-
vorite Instrument.” Each
session features a multi-
media story, an opportu-
nity to hear one or more
GLCO musicians demon-
strate and explain how
their instruments work,
and fun music-related ac-
tivities for kids. 10:30 AM
Petoskey, 1 PM
Charlevoix. Schedule: Jan.
8: Woodwinds, Feb. 12:
Voice, Keyboards, Mar. 12:
Horns

NORTHERN MICHIGAN
SNOWMOBILING
State-designated trails

are open Dec. 1 through
March 31 and grooming
occurs when there is
enough snow on the
ground. The snowmobile
program is 100% funded
with your trail permit dol-
lars. Be sure to bookmark
Mi.gov/Snowmobiling so
you can keep up with trail
closures, find trail eti-
quette refreshers, view
maps and print trail seg-
ment maps. Special
thanks to the volunteer
snowmobile clubs and
groups who assist with
trail signage and groom-
ing on state-designated
snowmobile trails
throughout the season.
The snowmobile program
is 100% funded with trail
permit dollars.

EAST JORDAN
THE DEPOT JORDAN

VALLEY TEEN

CENTER
The Depot Jordan Val-

ley Teen Center are in
their new location. The
Teen Center is now lo-
cated in the lower level of
the St. Joseph Parish Hall,
207 Nicholls Street, East
Jordan 

BOYNE CITY
FARMERS MARKET
Join us Saturday for the

indoor market season in
the Veterans Park Pavil-
ion. Each Saturday from
here on out we will be
there from 9am - NOON.

CHARLEVOIX
Hospice of  Northwest

Michigan invites you to
join our Monthly adult
grief, loss & bereavement
support group, which
takes place the 2nd Sun-
day of  each month from 4-
5pm at the First Baptist
Church, 6781 M66 North.
This program is open to
anyone in our community
looking for assistance in
their grief  process and is
facilitated by Rev. David
Behling. There is no
charge to attend. Please
feel free to call Hospice at
231-547-7659 to register or
for more information.

EAST JORDAN
CANCER SUPPORT

GROUP
Cancer and Caregiver

Support group meets at
10am the 3rd Saturday of
each month at
Lighthoiuse Missionary
Church

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
FINANCIAL
ASSISTANCE
AVAILABLE

Have you experienced fi-
nancial hardship due to
the COVID-19 crisis?
Northwest Michigan Com-
munity Action Agency
(NMCAA) has funding
from the federal CARES
Act to assist with various
needs (utility help, car re-
pairs, housing costs, dia-
pers, baby formula, phone
bills, etc.). You may be eli-
gible for assistance if  you
meet income guidelines
and live in NMCAA’s serv-
ice area (Antrim, Benzie,
Charlevoix, Emmet,
Grand Traverse, Kalka-
ska, Leelanau, Missaukee,
Roscommon, and Wexford
Counties). To apply for
help, please contact our
CARES Intake Specialist
at 800-632-7334.

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
ADVERTISING
FUNDS THE

CHARLEVOIX
COUNTY NEWS

We love to run commu-
nity announcements and
news releases about all
the things happening in
Northern Michigan in the
Charlevoix County News.
We help publicize hun-
dreds of  events and activi-
ties all across our area.
Readers love the fact that
the Charlevoix County
News is distributed by
mailed subscription or at
tons of  locations through-
out Boyne City, Boyne
Falls, Charlevoix, East
Jordan, Ellsworth and
Petoskey. However, it is ex-
pensive to publish this
newspaper each week
filled with positive news
and sports. Our main
source of  revenue comes
from advertising. If  your
business or organization
has an advertising budget,
be sure to include the
Charlevoix County News
in your plans. While other
local newspapers are
quickly fading, the
Charlevoix County News
is growing. Our news-
stand prices and advertis-
ing rates are far less than
any other paper and your
message will reach read-
ers all across the area.
Contact us at
Office@CharlevoixCoun-
tyNEWS.com or call 989-
732-8160. Locally owned
and operated. 
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Kevin Dudd
Super Clean Chimney Sweep
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Monday February 7, 2022
0246 Car deer crash on M75
S
1544 Minneapolis Flight
control requesting check on
overdue plane.  
TUESDAY FEBRUARY 8, 2022

0724 Arrested subject for
OUID on W Division St and West
St.
1044 Vehicle unlock on Divi-
sion St 
1208 Assist City of Jackson
PD with paper service on Boyne
Av
1345 Paper service in the
600 block of Boyne Av
Wednesday, February 9, 2022

0821 Report of vehicle run-
ning school bus lights on Park St
0856 Threats complaint in
the 1000 block of Boyne Av
1122 Bullying complaint in
the 1000 block of Boyne Av
1325 Disturbance reported
in the 500 block of N Lake St
1630 Asst. CPS in the 1000
block of Boyne Av
2000 Threats complaint in
the 300 block of E Division St
2229 Assist EMS in the 1100
block of Boyne Av.
2310 Assist Sheriff Dept. in
the 500 block of N Lake St
Thursday, February 10, 2022

0022 Suicidal subject in the

500 block of N Lake St
0825 Harassment complaint
from the 500 block of N Lake St
0839 Stalking complaint in
the 1000 block of Boyne Av.
0948 Assist Sheriff Dept. in
Boyne Falls
1012 Suspicious vehicle be-
hind the 1910 building this
morning.  
1358 Assist citizen in the
300 block of E Division St
1858 Suspicious activity in
the 300 block of E Division St.
1929 Report of missing wal-
let. 
2308 Arrest subject for OWI
in the 1100 block of Boyne Av. 

Friday, February 11, 2022
0901 Road Hazard on
Crozier Crest 0923
0930 Lock Down drill at the
school admin
1111 Assist EMS on Grove
St. 
1526 Assist Sheriff Dept. on
E. Cedar 
1555 Suspicious subject at
Veteran’s Park Pavilion
1915 Assist Sheriff Dept. on
Jacquay Rd 
1940 Responded to report
of B&E on W Court St.
2039 Intoxicated subject on
Park St 
2212 Peeping tom com-

plaint from the 300 block of E
Division St
Saturday, February 12, 2022

1130 Parking violation in
the 400 block of N Lake St 
1209 Assist Sheriff Dept. on
BC-EJ Rd. 
1529 Private property dam-
age crash in the 400 block of N
Lake St
2233 Suspicious subject in
Veterans Park Pavilion
SUNDAY FEBRUARY 13, 2022

0021 Citation issued for
speed and Refusing PBT at Front
St. and Second St.
0851 Assist EMS in the 300
block of E Division St

1209 Driving complaint in
the 500 block of N Lake St
1250 Report of missing
purse in the 400 block of N Lake
St purse. Was located at home.
1310 Driving complaint
coming in from 131 on 75 S. 
1455 Parking complaint in
the 200 block of E Main St.
1551 Assist fire on Roo-
sevelt St
1610 Driving complaint on
Behling at Wilson coming to-
wards town.

B O Y N E  C I T Y  P O L I C E  D E P A R T M E N T  I N C I D E N T  R E P O R T

News O N L I N E  AT  W W W. C H A R L E V O I XCO U N T Y N E W S . CO M

The Centers for Disease
Control and Prevention
(CDC) announced Friday it is
relaxing its mask guidance
for communities where hos-
pitals are not under high
strain of  COVID-19 cases.
Under the new guidance,
nearly 70% of  the U.S. popula-
tion lives in an area consid-
ered to be low or medium
risk, and residents there are
advised they can go indoors
without masks. 

The CDC recommends con-
tinued mask use in communi-
ties where serious cases of
COVID-19 are straining the
health system and of  course
for anyone who needs a
higher level of  protection for
themselves or their family. 

“As of  Monday, Feb. 28, all
counties in our jurisdiction
are at medium or low risk,”
said Lisa Peacock, Health Of-
ficer for the Health Depart-
ment of  Northwest Michigan,
which includes the counties
of  Antrim, Charlevoix,
Emmet, and Otsego. “To de-
termine the COVID-19 com-

munity level, the CDC looks
at a combination of  three
metrics – new COVID-19 ad-
missions per 100,000 popula-
tion in the past 7 days, the
percent of  staffed inpatient
beds occupied by COVID-19
patients, and total new
COVID-19 cases per 100,000
population in the past 7

days.” 
According to the CDC, new

COVID-19 admissions and the
percent of  staffed inpatient
beds occupied represent the
current potential strain on
the health system. Data on
new cases acts as an early
warning indicator of  poten-
tial increases in health sys-

tem strain in the event of  a
COVID-19 surge. Using these
data, the COVID-19 commu-
nity level is classified as low,
medium, or high. Currently
in the Health Department of
Northwest Michigan jurisdic-
tion, Charlevoix and Emmet
counties are considered at
“low” risk and Antrim and

Otsego counties are labeled
“medium” risk. To check
your county’s COVID-19 com-
munity level, click here. The
Michigan Department of
Health and Human Services
also recently released up-
dated guidance on masking
as well as an updated sum-
mary of  pandemic phases in-
dicating our state is
currently in a phase of  Re-
covery.  

“The move to ease up on
universal masking reflects
current conditions at this
phase of  the coronavirus
pandemic, including wide-
spread immunity through
vaccination and prior infec-
tion as well as better access
to testing and treatments,”
Peacock noted. “Regardless,
there may be groups of  peo-
ple who want to or should
continue wearing a mask, in-
cluding anyone with underly-
ing health conditions, those
who live with someone with
high risk factors, anyone who
is immunocompromised, as
well as those who just feel

safer wearing a mask.” See
the CDC when and where to
wear a mask or respirator. 

The importance of  being
fully vaccinated against
COVID-19 continues to be em-
phasized by health officials: 

·        Get vaccinated and/or
get your booster.  

·         Get tested if  you are
exposed to COVID-19 or feel-
ing any symptoms.  

·         Isolate and quaran-
tine if  you are exposed.  

In addition, the health de-
partment is promoting test-
ing at its new mobile unit.
Walk-ins are welcome at the
mobile unit following loca-
tions: 

·         Tuesday, March 1: E-
Free Church 1649 E M-32
Gaylord, 8:15 am - 12:15 pm 

·         Wednesday, March 2:
HDNW 205 Grove St.
Mancelona, 8:15 am - 12:15 pm 

·         Thursday, March 3:
HDNW 220 W. Garfield
Charlevoix, 8:15 am - 12:15 pm 

Additional testing loca-
tions and dates are available
at nwhealth.org/covidtest. 

CDC revises mask guidance for communities where
hospitals seeing less strain on capacity 

“Once an inva-
sive species ar-
rives, it’s about
impossible to get
rid of  it.”

~Sean Hanna 

BY PATRICK W. C. BEVIER

When University of  Col-
orado Ecology Professor
Patrick Kociolek told me
there were 180 separate inva-
sive species in Lake Michi-
gan alone, I almost fell off
my barstool! Actually, I was
in a folding chair in his
rather spartan office at the
U. of  M. Douglas Lake Bio-
logical Research Station
near Pellston. 

The alarming news that
Dr. Kociolek relayed is true.
Our once pristine and unin-
vaded freshwater oceans are
now teaming with marine or-
ganisms. They’ve inadver-
tently hitch-hiked to the
Great Lakes via the St.
Lawrence Seaway in the bal-
last water of  ocean-going
ships. Other fresh and salt-
water species have been
transported on recreational
and commercial watercraft
from various places in the
US and Canada, while others
have been purposefully
planted. From miniscule zoo-
plankton to underwater jun-
gles of  watermilfoil a great
diversity of  invasive species
have established a firm
foothold in our aquatic
ecosystems. What’s worse is
that many invasives have
benefited from what biolo-
gists call a, “competitive ad-
vantage” when introduced to
new ecosystems, out compet-
ing native species for valu-
able resources. I’m calling
this invasion an “ocean-ifica-
tion” knowing full-well
that’s not a real word. How-
ever, it describes the process
quite appropriately. Here’s a
sampling of  short stories on
some of  our most intriguing,
and sometimes insidious, in-
vaders:

Lascivious Lamprey: Prob-
ably the most recognizable,

and the most hideous, of  all
of  our marine invaders are
sea lampreys (Petromyzon
marinus). These eel-like fish
were first introduced to the
Great Lakes in the early
1920’s and played a key role
in almost decimating popula-
tions of  one of  our most
prized sportfish, the lake
trout. They feature a mouth,
straight out of  the most sin-
ister science fiction stories,
equipped with strong circu-
lar suction cup lips sur-
rounding dozens of
razor-sharp rasping teeth.
This ancient species uses
this well-adapted mouth to
lock on to larger fish, much
like a leech on smaller vic-
tims, and gradually suck
blood and other life-essential
fluids from the host. If  the
lamprey stays on the prey
for an extended amount of
time it can cause the fish to
become so weak that it is
susceptible to diseases and
often dies. The good news is
that fisheries biologists have
been relatively successful at
controlling lamprey num-
bers in the past decade. Con-
trol strategies include
trapping them, and the use
of  pheromone attractors and
lampricides in the rivers in
which they spawn. Regard-
less, lampreys are still pres-
ent in decent numbers and
continue to prey on some of
our most valuable sportfish.  

The Good, the Bad, and
the Gobies:  Round gobies

(Neogobius melanostomus),
a small, mottled, pop-eyed,
clown-lipped bottom
dwelling fish, were first dis-
covered in the St. Clair River
in 1990. Like most invasive
species they likely entered
through the ballast water of
ocean-going ships. It took
them almost two decades to
establish significant popula-
tions but are now so prolific
that state biologists estimate
there may be as many as ten
gobies for every square foot
of  shoreline lake bottom!
Fisheries experts have also
sited that both smallmouth
bass and lake trout have
adapted very well to eating
gobies and that they are see-
ing significant growth in
these two gamefish species
because of  this shift in diet.
Indeed, I’ve caught lakers off
the shoreline of  Petoskey
that are so full of  gobies
they’re actually pouring out
of  their mouths! These seem-
ingly positive effects may not
outweigh the fact that gobies
are competing with our na-
tive fish for valuable re-
sources as well as that they
are voracious nest predators
of  some of  our most valued
sportfish species.  

Mussel-Mania: Zebra mus-
sels (Dreissena polymorpha)
and their close kin the
quagga mussels (Dreissena
bugensis) have established
unreal population densities
in our waters. What’s worse
is that Kociolek, and his col-

legues, believe that the
wastes produced by these
mollusks have made the lake
bottoms so rich in nutrients
that we have seen massive
algal blooms of  golden
brown algae. This native
plant, that was once fairly
scarce, now literally blan-
kets the shorelines of  the
northern Great Lakes and
inland waters including
Torch Lake and Crystal
Lake.

I have to admit that as an
avid snorkeler and SCUBA
diver in Michigan I have to
tip my hat to these mussels.
Their abundance and effi-
cient filter feeding nature
has created the clearest
water the Great Lakes has
ever boasted.  However, all
things considered, these in-
vaders have had more of  a
negative impact on our
ecosystems than a positive
one.  Studies conducted by
the U. of  M. Biological Re-
search Station indicate they
crowd out and negatively af-
fect growth of  native clam
species. 

Splendid Smelt: But not all
invasives have overt negative
impacts. Anyone who has
ever gone smelt dipping, or
who has tasted these slender
silver fish, knows that the
rainbow smelt (Osmerus
mordax) is an epicurean de-
light, and certainly a wel-
come visitor. Sportspeople
also know that their num-
bers have absolutely plum-

meted in the last few
decades. They are very diffi-
cult to find in numbers war-
ranting wading in cold,
hip-deep water to scoop up
what used to be trash-can
filling proportions. Con-
versely, we’ve caught them
in substantial numbers, al-
beit one fish at a time, on
light ice fishing gear in in-
land lakes including Higgins,
Crystal, and Torch.  

All-Present Alewives:
Alewives (Alosa pseudo-
harengus) were an early ar-
riving invasive species that
first showed up in the Great
Lakes in the 1870’s. They’re
numbers ballooned until in
the 1950’s and 60’s they had
unprecedented fish die-offs. I
still remember walking
along the shoreline of  Lake
Huron on a vacation and see-
ing dead alewives stacked
three feet high along the en-
tire length of  the beach. The
smell was so atrocious that it
led to citizens demanding an-
swers from the DNR. The bi-
ologists from that agency
brainstormed and came up
with a solution that is now
considered to be, “the great-
est fisheries experiment in
the history of  Michigan.”
That being the stocking of
pacific salmon -Coho and
Chinook species – in the mid
1960’s to prey on the excess
alewives. Needless to say, the
experiment worked and is
now a xx billion dollar boon
to the Michigan outdoor
economy.  

Milfoil Multitudes:
Eurasian watermilfoil
(Myriophyllum spicatum) is
an aquatic plant that has
wreaked havoc on Michigan
waters. It is believed to have
first invaded the Great Lakes
State in the xxx’s (1900 or
2000??) from  

Spiny Snipers: Perhaps
the most serious stone-cold
killers among our invasive
species are about the length
of  your thumb nail. They’re
called spiny water fleas
(Bythotrephes longimanus)
and they are absolutely dev-
astating to our native zoo-
plankton species that are the
foundation of  our aquatic
food webs. In particular, ex-
traordinarily valuable zoo-

plankton from the genus
Daphnia are being deci-
mated by these invaders na-
tive to Lake Ladoga near the
Baltic Sea of  Russia no less.
Water fleas are not insects as
the name might suggest but
are also zooplankton, but are
several times the size of
Daphnia. They are sight
predators and possess a sin-
gle large eyespot, formidable
mandibles, and a spiny tail
that makes up 70 percent of
their length. What makes
them particularly heinous is
that in addition to eating our
native plankton species they
kill small fish that try to eat
them because of  the tail re-
sembling a rose stem. Michi-
gan anglers know the pests
well as they will often real in
clumps of  them stuck to fish-
ing lines. While I rarely ap-
prove of  this type of
behavior if  you happen to
“land” any of  these obnox-
ious organisms, please do
not allow them back in the
water.  

Other noteworthy inva-
sives are the common carp
introduced from Europe in
the 1890’s, ruffe fish from
Eurasia in the 1980’s, and
tiny New Zealand mud snails
which started showing up in
our trout streams within the
last decade. Technically,
even Coho and Chinook
salmon are invasives. But, of
course, they were stocked
purposefully by fisheries bi-
ologists in the mid-1960’s in
what is often referred to as,
“the greatest fisheries suc-
cess story in Michigan his-
tory!” 

These are just a few of  the
hundreds of  invasive marine
invaders that now inhabit
Michigan waters. Many go
unnoticed, however, as the
vast majority are either
plants or microscopic organ-
isms. Regardless, these once
ocean-going organisms now
play a key role in the aquatic
ecosystems of  the Wolverine
State. While some are heav-
ily studied, the jury is still
out regarding the eventual
impacts of  many of  these in-
vasives on our native
species.  

N O R T H E R N  M I C H I G A N  O U T D O O R S

Quagga mussels and Round Gobies are two marine intruders that have thrived in the waters of the Great Lakes (photo
Patrick Bevier).  

The “Ocean-ification” of the Great Lakes
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Yoga for Health: Yoga, Med-
itation and Breathing Prac-
tices 
Mondays through March 14 
Online Mondays • 5:30 pm •
Via Zoom – Please register
Heidi Grace of  Charlevoix
Yoga will lead you through
the building blocks of  yoga
exploring ways to improve
balance, reduce stress, and
build strength. Breathing
exercises will be introduced
as tools for quieting the
mind, calming the nervous
system, and focusing on the
present. All levels are wel-
come and practice can be
modified to fit your individ-
ual needs. Online classes
are 60 minutes. Heidi will
also offer weekly nutrition
and seasonal practices that
can support your overall
well-being.

Bier’s & Books Club:
Up North in Michigan:
A Portrait of  Place in
Four Seasons by Jerry
Dennis 
Wednesday, March 2 • 6:00
pm – Please register 
Bier’s Inwood Brewery 17959
Ferry Road, Charlevoix 
Award winning, Traverse
City nature writer Jerry
Dennis’s new collection Up
North in Michigan, cap-
tures his lifelong journey to
better know this place he
calls home by exploring it
in every season, in every
kind of  weather, on foot, on

bicycle, in canoes and cars. 
·   Ages 21 + • Limited At-
tendance:  
·  Please Register online
or call (231)237-7340  
·  Cost: The discussion is
free but the beverages are
not 

Beyond Telling: A one-
man play performed by
William Campbell 
Tuesday, March 8 • 6:30 pm 
Community Room 
Beyond Telling is a one-
man play written by Ray-
mond Goodwin and
performed by William
Campbell. It tells the story
of  a newspaper columnist
who confronts a night of  do-
mestic terror. George
Telling remembers and re-
lives the circumstances of  a
horrific attack in a quiet
Michigan City.

BookTalkers: The
Lager Queen of  Min-
nesota by J. Ryan
Stradal 
Monday, March 21 • 6:00 pm
- Please register 
Armstrong Conference
Room
Once upon a time, Helen
Blotz inherited the family
farm, alienating her sister
Edith. Helen uses the pro-
ceeds to transform husband
Orval’s family soda busi-
ness into the hottest brew-
ery in Minnesota. Even as
Edith’s granddaughter

Diana launches her own
brewpub, Helen’s business
starts sledding downhill,
but there’s a chance that
Edith’s Rhubarb Pie in a
Bottle Ale might save the
day. A love story to Min-
nesota, craft beer, and the
power of  second chances,
this humorous novel by J.
Ryan Stradal is a testament
to the setbacks and achieve-
ments that come with fol-
lowing one’s passion.

Winter Blues Concert
Series: Peter Jensen 
Monday, March 28 • 6:30 pm 
Community Room 
Peter Allen Jensen is a
Country Blues fingerstyle
guitarist and singer from
Petoskey, MI. After spend-
ing several years studying
the Chicago Blues style,
Peter has gone acoustic and
now plays a variety of  fin-
gerstyle Country Blues,
Ragtime and instrumental
music. Peter also writes his
own style of  Americana in-
strumental music inspired
by John Fahey and Leo Kot-
tke. 

Up North in Michigan:
A Portrait of  Place in
Four Seasons with au-
thor Jerry Dennis 
Tuesday, March 29 • 6:30 pm 
Community Room 
Award winning, Traverse
City based nature writer
Jerry Dennis’ new collec-
tion Up North in Michigan,

captures his lifelong jour-
ney to better know this
place he calls home by ex-
ploring it in every season,
in every kind of  weather, on
foot, on bicycle, in canoes
and cars. The essays in this
book are a reflection on the
Up North that can only be
experienced through your
feet and fingertips, through
your ears, mouth, and nose. 

Tech Class: Finding &
Enjoying eBooks 
Thursday, March 31 • 1:00 -
3:00 pm 
Community Room 
Registration Required 
Did you know that you can
download eBooks, audio-
books, and even music for
free just using your Library
Card? You can! Come learn
how to use this great bonus
of  CPL membership. Bring
a laptop, tablet, or phone
that you intend to use for
reading or listening.  Please
Register online or call
(231)237-7340  

For more information,
please feel free to contact
the Charlevoix Public Li-
brary at 231-237-7340 or
email us at
reference@charlevoixli-
brary.org and visit our web-
site at
www.charlevoixlibrary.org. 

Charlevoix Public Library March Events

PETOSKEY – February 28,
2022 – St. Michael High
School (SMHS), Northern
Michigan’s only Classical
Catholic high school, is very
pleased to announce “Defend
Us in Battle!”: The 2022
SMHS Speaker Series!

As in recent years, SMHS
will bring prominent speak-
ers to Northern Michigan
this spring, presenting the
community with the benefits
of  Classical education, espe-
cially within the current cul-
tural landscape, as well as a
primer on the rigorous,
faith-filled curriculum par-
ticular to St. Michael.  This
year’s speaker line-up fea-
tures:

AN EVENING WITH
DWIGHT LONGENECKER –
MARCH 17 AT THE SMHS
SCHOOLHOUSE!

The St. Michael Spring
Gala featuring Joseph
Pearce – April 23 at Grand
Unity Event Center!

The St. Michael Gradua-
tion featuring Anthony Es-
olen – May 29 at Grand Unity
Event Center!

SMHS Headmaster Dr.
Richard Brake stated, “As
parents nationwide increas-
ingly demand that schools
respect their traditional val-
ues and their role as the pri-
mary educators of  their
children, the time is now to
take a fresh look at St.
Michael High School.  Our
Speaker Series events pro-
vide a perfect venue to be-
come better acquainted with
an educational model that is
sweeping our country.  We
invite all who want a better
education for their child to
learn more about what we’re
doing every day at St.
Michael – “High School with
a Higher Purpose!”

“CLASSICAL EDUCATION
IN AN ATHEISTIC AGE”
WITH FR. DWIGHT LONGE-
NECKER!

Thursday, March 17 at
6:30pm at SMHS (2225 Sum-
mit Park Drive)

Fr. Longenecker is a Sen-
ior Contributor at The Imag-
inative Conservative and is
regularly featured in many
other magazines, papers, and
journals.

Raised as an Evangelical
Christian and later ordained
as an Anglican priest, Fr.
Longenecker and his family
were received into the
Catholic Church in 1995, and
he became a Catholic priest
a decade later.  He is a pro-
lific writer, with twenty
books to his credit including
his latest, “Beheading Hydra
– A Radical Plan for Chris-
tians in an Atheistic Age”.

This event is free and open
to the public.  Freewill offer-
ings are appreciated!

THE ST. MICHAEL SPRING
GALA, FEATURING “CLAS-
SICAL EDUCATION AND
THE WISDOM OF G. K.
CHESTERTON” WITH
KEYNOTE SPEAKER MR.
JOSEPH PEARCE!

Saturday, April 23 at
5:30pm at Grand Unity Event
Center (1106 Charlevoix Ave)

Mr. Pearce is a distin-
guished Catholic author and
speaker, a regular guest on
radio, television, podcasts,
and webcasts, and a lecturer
at literary events worldwide.

He is Director of  Book Pub-
lishing at the Augustine In-
stitute, a senior instructor
with Homeschool Connec-
tions, and a Senior Contribu-
tor at Crisis.

An acclaimed biographer
and scholar, Mr. Pearce has
authored dozens of  best-sell-
ing books, including Tolkien:
Man and Myth, C. S. Lewis
and The Catholic Church,
Wisdom and Innocence: A
Life of  G.K. Chesterton, and
Solzhenitsyn: A Soul in
Exile.  His latest book is
Benedict XVI: Defender of
the Faith.

The St. Michael Gala is a
fundraising event designed
to highlight the school’s in-
trinsic “Truth, Goodness,
and Beauty”, as well as its
full integration into the
Chesterton Schools Network.
Tickets are $100 per person,
with table sponsorships
available by contacting Dr.
Brake at
drbrake@stmichaelchester-
ton.org or 231-489-3302.

ST. MICHAEL COMMENCE-
MENT CEREMONY, FEA-
TURING “REBUILDING
CULTURE THROUGH CLAS-
SICAL EDUCATION” WITH
SPEAKER DR. ANTHONY
ESOLEN!

Sunday, May 29 at 4:00pm
at Grand Unity Event Center
(1106 Charlevoix Ave)

A distinguished author,
poet, and commentator, Dr.
Esolen has written more
than 25 books, and has a spe-
cial affinity for classical
schooling and Christian
apologetics.  He and his wife
led their state’s homeschool-
ing organization for many
years.

His book Ten Ways to De-
stroy the Imagination of
Your Child has been de-
scribed as “a worthy succes-
sor to C.S. Lewis’ The
Abolition of  Man”, and its se-
quel, Life Under Compul-
sion, has been called
“essential reading for par-
ents, educators, and anyone
who is concerned to rescue
children from the tedious
and vacuous thing childhood
has become.”

Of  particular interest to
Christians are his two most
recent works, Out of  the
Ashes: Rebuilding American
Culture, and its sequel, Nos-
talgia: Going Home in a
Homeless World.

Dr. Esolen’s address will
punctuate St. Michael com-
mencement exercises that
will also feature remarks by
our Headmaster and Valedic-
torian, as well as the award-
ing of  diplomas.  He will
address the students via
Zoom.

Dr. Brake concluded, “We
hope you’ll join us for our
Speaker Series events this
spring – and please stay
tuned for an exciting late ad-
dition to our line-up!  As al-
ways, we appreciate your
continued prayers and sup-
port!”

For up to-date informa-
tion, visit the Speaker Series
webpage at…
https://stmichaelchester-
ton.org/speaker-series/.

St. Michael High School is
High School with a Higher
Purpose and a proud mem-
ber of  the Chesterton
Schools Network, the largest
and fastest-growing network
of  its kind in the country.
SMHS welcomes all families
who seek a better education
and faith formation for their
students and offers tuition
assistance to qualifying fam-
ilies.

Established in 2013, the St.
Michael mission is to nur-
ture and elevate a new gen-
eration of  joyful leaders
educated in the Classical tra-
dition and the truth of  the
Catholic faith.  For informa-
tion on SMHS, visit the
school website at
https://stmichaelchester-
ton.org or contact Headmas-
ter Dr. Richard Brake at
drbrake@stmichaelchester-
ton.org

St. Michael High School
Announces Its 
2022 Speaker Series!
Defend Us in Battle: Classical Edu-
cation & the Future of America!

LANSING, Mich. – Gover-
nor Gretchen Whitmer
today announced applica-
tions are now being ac-
cepted through Thursday,
March 31 for the new Grow-
ing MI Business grant pro-
gram, which was signed into
law at the end of  last year to
deliver $409 million in addi-
tional support to businesses
across the state.  

“My number one goal is to
put Michigan first, and that
means making sure Michi-
gan businesses have the re-
sources they need to build
on our economic momen-
tum,” said Governor
Gretchen Whitmer. “Over
the last year, my adminis-
tration has worked hard to
add 220,000 jobs and help
businesses bounce back.
The Growing MI Business
Grant Program will make a
difference for Michigan’s
business owners and com-
munities across our state. I
will continue supporting
Michigan’s resilient, innova-
tive businesses as they work
to expand operations and
create more jobs.” 

Under the Growing MI
Business grant program, eli-
gible businesses in opera-
tion before October 1, 2019,
may receive a grant up to $5
million due to financial
hardship. Eligible busi-
nesses that began operating
between October 1, 2019, and
May 31, 2020, may receive a
grant equal to 25% of  cer-
tain specified costs. 

Effective today, individu-
als can apply for business
resources online at
www.michigan.gov/abr. 

Each business must sub-
mit a completed online ap-

plication to the Michigan
Department of  Treasury no
later than 11:59 p.m. EST
Thursday, March 31. Grant
awardees will be notified in
the spring and grant awards
will be distributed by July 1,
2022.  

Businesses interested in
applying for a grant are en-
couraged to attend an infor-
mation webinar from 1-2
p.m. EST on Monday, March
7. Details for signing up for
the webinar can be found on
the grant program's web-
site.   

"Businesses thinking
about applying are strongly
encouraged to sign up for
our March 7 webinar," said
State Treasurer Rachael Eu-
banks. "It will be a great op-
portunity to learn about the
details of  the program and
ask questions. It is critical
for businesses to submit a
correct application to avoid
processing delays or exclu-
sion from the program."  

Growing MI Business
grants may be prorated de-
pending upon the number of
businesses that apply to en-
sure that all eligible busi-
nesses can receive funding.
Grants will not be distrib-
uted based on a first come,
first serve basis. 

Under state law, there are
nine types of  businesses eli-
gible a grant:  

·    Entertainment venues 
·    Recreational facilities

and public places of  amuse-
ment 

·    Barbers and cosmetolo-
gists 

·    Exercise facilities 
·    Food service establish-

ments 

·    Nursery dealers and
growers 

·    Athletic trainers 
·    Body art facilities 
·    Hotels and bed &

breakfast establishments 

Getting Things Done  
Governor Whitmer is

committed to supporting
small businesses as Michi-
gan emerges from the pan-
demic and ushers in a new
era of  prosperity. Through
COVID, the state imple-
mented 23 economic relief
programs for businesses,
supporting more than 25,000
companies and retaining
more than 200,000 jobs. Now,
Governor Whitmer is dedi-
cated to helping small busi-
nesses navigate existing
programs and services
available to help them re-
cover and thrive for years to
come. Recently, the gover-
nor laid out a $2.1 billion
proposal to grow Michigan’s
middle class, support small
businesses, and invest in
communities by tackling
several underlying issues.
As Michigan’s economic
jumpstart continues, bol-
stered by a strong GDP, and
a historic surplus, Governor
Whitmer’s proposals will
tackle underlying issues
faced by small businesses
and take advantage of  the
massive influx of  federal re-
sources Michigan has re-
ceived to deliver meaningful
change that makes a real
difference for small busi-
nesses and Michigan work-
ers.   

Key Numbers  
·     Ushered in 8.3% GDP

growth, best in the Midwest

again and third-best nation-
wide in Q2.   

·     Took Michigan from a
projected $3 billion deficit to
a $7 billion surplus.   

·     Launched 23 economic
relief  programs providing
over $240 million in vital
economic support to small
businesses across all 83
Michigan counties. The pro-
grams supported over 25,000
companies and retained
over 200,000 jobs with nearly
75% of  support going to
restaurants, bars, retailers
and other service industry
small businesses.     

Saved 52,500 jobs by pro-
viding grants to 6,000 small
businesses.  

·    Provided $100 million
through the Small Business
Restart Program to help
restaurants and other place-
based businesses cover costs
by providing grants up to
$20,000 for mortgage, rent,
taxes, payroll and other op-
erating expenses.   

·    Expanded Work Share
to offer employers greater
flexibility as they brought
employees back from unem-
ployment, provided over
$550 million, preserved over
110,000 jobs, and helped
nearly 2,600 employers re-
tain workers and bring them
back to the workforce.   

·    Set up free virtual job
fairs connecting over 2,600
employers and 9,900 job
seekers.   

Additional information
about the Growing MI Busi-
ness Grant Program – in-
cluding frequently asked
questions, fact sheets and
previously recorded webi-
nars – can be found on
www.michigan.gov/abr.  

Governor Whitmer Launches Growing MI Business
Grant Program to Deliver $409 Million to Support
Michigan Businesses and Grow Economy 

has helped:
·   expand services to

schools including school-
based health clinics, mental
health services and served
in an advisory role to
schools throughout various
health concerns, including
the current COVID-19 pan-
demic;

·  expand the Northern
Michigan Community
Health Innovation Region
through strong regional
partnerships to assure the
top health needs of  the com-
munity are addressed
through effective and sus-

tainable services:
·   navigate the two-year

pandemic response, includ-
ing working with commu-
nity partners to establish
one of  the first drive
through testing sites in
northern Michigan at the
Emmet County Fair-
grounds, organize vaccina-
tion clinics for thousands of
residents and their families,
arranged for additional test-
ing sites, as well as the dis-
tribution of  free home tests
and KN95 masks;

·  oversee numerous state
and federal grants that have
been awarded to the health
department to provide vital
services to citizens in the re-
gion;

·  planned and overseen

expansion of  the Northern
Michigan Regional Lab in
Gaylord to serve as a re-
gional resource for northern
Michigan for COVID testing,
water testing and waste-
water surveillance; and

·  acquire acquisition of  a
mobile unit to expand the
reach of  services to more

rural regions.
“I am very saddened to

offer my resignation,” Pea-
cock said. “I love my job, the
employees I work with, and
our community partners
who support our mission,”
she added.

Peacock is working with
the health department lead-
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$2.00
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BY: DOM SANTANA
The Charlevoix Rayders

would have one big accom-
plishment left to check off be-
fore the end of  the regular
season. The team hosted
Manton on Thursday, Febru-
ary 24 for senior night and
the final game of  the regular
season. 

The Rayders would end up
finding it to be a struggle
against Manton. In the end
they would end up falling by
a final score of  37-25. The
Rayders would have a big mo-
ment in the game when sen-
ior Taylor Petrosky would hit
the 1,000 point mark in her
career. A massive milestone
for the senior that has been a
driving force behind the Ray-
ders success.  

The Rayders would end up
finishing the regular season
with a record of  7-13. They
started postseason play on
Monday, February 28 against
East Jordan in the first round
of  the district tournament. 

The Rayders jumped out to
a solid lead from the opening
tip. They would hold a 15-8
lead over the Red Devils after
the first quarter. That lead
would only continue to grow
in the second quarter as they
would hold a 31-14 lead at

halftime.
In the third quarter, the

lead would only continue to
grow, it would turn into a 40-
29 deficit for the Red Devils.
The win would not come eas-
ily though, as the Red Devils
would come storming back.
The gap would close to just
four points late in the game.
The Rayders would have to
dig deep to secure a 48-44 vic-
tory and send them to the
second round of  the tourna-
ment. 

The Rayders were led by
Petrosky with 22 points. The
Rayders will take on Harbor
Springs on Wednesday,
March 2. While the Red Dev-
ils see their season come to
an end with an overall record
of  8-13. 
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Charlevoix Public Library March Events
athlete    weekof

the
Kelan Pletcher     
Ellsworth Lancers 
Boys Basketball

Kelan Pletcher would lead the
way with 26 points in the 58-52
Lancers win over UP powerhouse
Pickford last week. 

Braylyn Rincon     
Boyne City Ramblers 
Girls Basketball

Braylyn Rincon with 4 three
point baskets for a total of 12
points in the 1st round of district
play in the 43-29 win over
Cheboygan..

Subscribe
Distributed to Boyne City, East Jordan, Charlevoix,
Boyne Falls, Walloon Lake, Ellsworth and Atwood.

Contact Us today at: 989-732-8160

friendly& positive news and sports
covering all of Charlevoix County

AND OUTDOORS

CALL (989) 732-8160
FAX (888) 854-7441

SPORTS@CHARLEVOIXCOUNTYNEWS.COM

G I R L S  B A S K E T B A L L

Governor Whitmer Launches Growing MI Business
Grant Program to Deliver $409 Million to Support
Michigan Businesses and Grow Economy 

EJ #24 Mycah Heise pulls up for a jump shot in the first half.  Photo by Scott
Richards.

Charlevoix’s  #14 Mikayla Sharrow goes for a lay up in the second half.  Photo
by Scott Richards.

Charlevoix’s TaylorPetrosky goes in for a layup in the second half.  Photo by Scott
Richards.

Petrosky Hits 1,000 points, Red Devils
season ends in first round of districts

Charlevoix’s Taylor Petrosky and team mate shut down EJ.  Photo by Scott Richards.

TAYLOR PETROSKY 



BY: DOM SANTINA

CHARLEVOIX
The Boyne City Boys bas-

ketball team would host rival
Charlevoix on Wednesday,
February 23. 

The Rayders would start
the first quarter off just a
touch better than the Ram-
blers. As they would hold a
16-14 lead. The second quar-
ter would end up swinging in
favor of  the Ramblers, as
they would claim a 3 point

lead at halftime, 33-30. 
The third quarter would be

a more defensive quarter, as
the Ramblers would score
one point more than the Ray-
ders and expand their lead to
4. In the fourth quarter, the
Rayders would be able to
close back in, but not nearly
enough. As the Ramblers
would hold on for a 53-50 vic-
tory. 

The Ramblers would have
two players in double figures
for scoring, as Alex Cal-
caterra would lead the way
with 16 points. While Mason

Wilcox would contribute 14
points. The win moves the
Ramblers to 12-5 on the sea-
son and to 7-5 in the Lake
Michigan Conference. The
team would be back in action
on Friday, February 25 at
Traverse City St. Francis. 

TRAVERSE CITY 
ST. FRANCIS

The Ramblers would have
a tough test in front of  them.
The Gladiators were 13-0 in
the Lake Michigan Confer-
ence and 16-2 overall. The
clear and obvious top team in
the conference would not
have too much of  a struggle
against the Ramblers. As the
Gladiators would end up tak-
ing the matchup by a final
score of  58-40. 

The loss would move the
Ramblers record to 12-6 on
the season and 7-6 in the
LMC. The Ramblers would
have just two games remain-
ing in the regular season. As
they would travel to play
McBain on Monday, Febru-
ary 28 and then have
Petoskey on Tuesday, March
1. 

MCBAIN
In the battle of  Ramblers,

the Boyne City team would
draw the early advantage, as
the lead would be 15-9 after
the opening quarter. The
McBain Ramblers would try
to form a comeback in the
second quarter, but would
only be able to cut into the
lead by 1. The halftime score
would have the Boyne Ram-
blers up 25-20. 

The third quarter would be
very similar to the second
quarter, as both teams would
barely break 10 points. This

time though, the Boyne Ram-
blers would add 1 point to the
lead and hold the 6 point lead
into the final quarter. The de-
fensive battle would continue

to the fourth quarter, the
Ramblers would be able to
narrowly escape with a 47-40
victory over the Ramblers. 

The Ramblers would be led

by Jack Neer with 13 points.
The win moves the Ramblers
to 13-6 on the season. As they
will play Petoskey on Tues-
day, March 1 and have Kalka-
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B O Y S  B A S K E T B A L L

Ramblers finish week 2-1 in three tough games 

Rayder Caleb Stuck (34) gets to the lane as Rambler Aaron Bess (5) defends and Scotty Haley (35) rotates over to help.
(Photo by Chris Fiel)

Charlevoix’s Evan Solomon (12) brings the ball up-court as Boyne City’s Alex Calcaterra (11) defends and teammate Jack
Neer gives chase. (Photo by Chris Fiel)

Boyne’s Scotty Haley (35) wins the tip over Charlevoix’s Jack Gaffney (14). (Photo
by Chris Fiel)
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REQUEST A FREE QUOTE!

833-363-1981

Prepare for 
power outages 
with a Generac 
home standby 
generator

FREE
7-Year Extended Warranty*
A $695 Value! 

Limited Time O� er – Call for Details

Special Financing Available 
Subject to Credit Approval 
*To qualify, consumers must request a quote, purchase, install and activate the 
generator with a participating dealer. Call for a full list of terms and conditions. 
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G I R L S  B A S K E T B A L L

Ramblers finish week 2-1 in three tough games 

BY: DOM SANTINA

PETOSKEY
The Boyne City girls bas-

ketball team would travel to
play Petoskey on Wednesday,
February 23. A rough season
would lead to a very hard
game against the Northmen. 

The Ramblers would trail
6-4 after the opening quarter.
The offense would take off in
the second quarter and the
Ramblers would find them-
selves only down five more,
25-18 at halftime. 

The Ramblers would con-
tinue to fight in the second
half  but would end up losing
by a final score of  48-29. The
team would be led by Elly

Day with 8 points. The loss
would move the Ramblers to
5-14 on the season. The team
would have a quick turn-
around as they would wel-
come Bellaire for senior
night at home on Thursday,
February 24. 

BELLAIRE
The Ramblers would be

looking for a spark to send
the seniors out with one final
win at home against Bellaire. 

The teams would be tied at

6-6 after the first quarter. The
Eagles would be able to grab
a slim 2 point lead at half-
time. The Eagles would be
able to expand their lead in
the second half, as they
would hold a 27-19. The Ea-
gles would barely be able to
hold off a hard fight Ram-
blers team to secure a 29-26
victory. 

The Ramblers would come
up short on senior night and
would end the season with a
regular season record of  5-15.
The team would be led by

Grace Dawson with 14 points.
The Ramblers would have the
comforts of  home for the dis-
trict tournament which
started on February 28
against Cheboygan. 

CHEBOYGAN
What a difference a year

can make, last season the
Ramblers would be elimi-
nated in their first game of
the district tournament by
Cheboygan. 

This season would be a

whole new story, as the Ram-
blers would jump out to a 16-9
lead in the first quarter. That
momentum would only carry
through the second quarter
as they would stretch the
lead to 30-12 over the Chiefs. 

There would be a lot less
offensive production in the
third quarter, which would
allow the Ramblers to main-
tain their lead and hold a 33-
16 lead over them heading
into the fourth quarter. The
Ramblers would be able to
win their opening round dis-

trict game by a final score of
43-29. 

The team would be led by
Braylyn Rincon with 4 three
point baskets for a total of  12
points in the game. 

The Ramblers will move to
the semi-final match up on
Wednesday, March 2 at home
against Kingsley. It will be a
tough matchup for the Ram-
blers, as the Stags come into
the game with a 15-5 record. 
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Boyne guard, Ava Maginity (4) looks over the Chief defense, waiting for an open
teammate to pass to. (Photo by Chris Fiel)

Rambler senior, Harley Cadarette (13) puts up a shot against some tough Cheboy-
gan defense. (Photo by Chris Fiel)

Maddie Smith (21) of Boyne City, drives in for a layup attempt vs the Chiefs. (Photo
by Chris Fiel)

Boyne junior Braylyn Rincon (11) looks
to the inside on this play. (Photo by
Chris Fiel)

Ramblers earn opening round district win
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B O Y S  B A S K E T B A L L BOYS
BASKETBALL
STANDINGS

BIG NORTH CONFERENCE
Team                                Conf           Ovr
Cadillac                              7-3         14-5
TC Central                          7-3         10-7
Petoskey                            6-4         12-6
TC West                             6-4           9-9
Alpena                                4-6         10-8
Gaylord                             0-10         4-15

LAKE MICHIGAN 
CONFERENCE
St Francis                         14-0         17-2
Elk Rapids                        10-3         12-5
Boyne City                          8-6         13-6
East Jordan                        6-7         10-8
Grayling                              6-8         10-9
Charlevoix                          5-8           9-9
Harbor Springs                 3-10         7-10
Kalkaska                           2-12         4-14

SKI VALLEY CONFERENCE
Onaway                            15-1         18-1
Mancelona                        13-2         13-6
Joburg-Lewiston               10-5         12-6
Inland Lakes                       8-7         8-10
Bellaire                               7-7           9-9
Gaylord St Mary                 7-8         7-12
Pellston                            4-10         5-12
Central Lake                     3-12         4-14
Forest Area                       0-15         0-17

STRAITS AREA 
CONFERENCE
Rudyard                              7-1         17-1
St Ignace                            6-2         14-4
Sault                                   4-4          8-11
Cheboygan                         2-6         5-13
Newberry                            2-7           8-9

NORTHERN LAKES 
CONFERENCE
Ellsworth                           11-0         16-3
Mackinaw City                    9-2         12-7
Harbor Lt Chr                     7-5         10-8
Alanson                              5-6           6-7
North Mich Chr                   3-7           6-9
Boyne Falls                        2-9          4-11
Wolverine                           1-9         2-12

NORTH STAR -
BIG DIPPER
Oscoda                               7-1          11-7
Mio                                     5-2           9-7
Alcona                                5-3         10-7
Rogers City                        2-6          6-11
W-P                                    0-7         1-16

NORTH STAR -
LITTLE DIPPER
Hillman                             10-0         19-0
Posen                                 7-3         12-6
Au Gres-Sims                     6-3          11-6
Atlanta                                4-5         7-10
Hale                                    1-8         3-15
Fairview                              0-9         0-18

GIRLS
BASKETBALL
STANDINGS

BIG NORTH 
CONFERENCE
Team                                Conf           Ovr
Petoskey                            8-2         14-7
Gaylord                               6-4         13-8
TC Central                          5-5          11-8
Alpena                                5-5         12-9
TC West                             4-6        10-11
Cadillac                              2-8         8-13

LAKE MICHIGAN 
CONFERENCE
Elk Rapids                        13-1         18-2
Harbor Springs                 12-2         18-2
St Francis                         11-3         15-6
Charlevoix                          7-7         8-13
East Jordan                        6-8         8-13
Boyne City                          5-9         6-15
Grayling                            2-12         7-14
Kalkaska                           0-14         0-18

SKI VALLEY 
CONFERENCE
Gaylord St Mary               13-1         18-2
Joburg-Lewiston               11-4         12-6
Inland Lakes                     10-4         12-8
Bellaire                               9-5         13-7
Central Lake                       6-8          11-9
Onaway                            4-10         8-13
Mancelona                        4-10         6-14
Forest Area                       0-15         1-19

STRAITS AREA 
CONFERENCE
St Ignace                            6-1         18-2
Sault                                   6-2         16-4
Rudyard                              3-3           9-8
Cheboygan                         2-6         8-13
Newberry                            0-5         0-14

NORTHERN LAKES 
CONFERENCE
Mackinaw City                  12-0         18-3
North Mich Chr                   8-2          11-5
Harbor Lt Chr                     7-3         12-7
Wolverine                           7-7         12-8
Ellsworth                             3-7         4-13
Alba                                    1-8         1-13
Alanson                              0-9         0-15

NORTH STAR LEAGUE-
BIG DIPPER
Posen                                 9-1         18-1
Hillman                               9-1         12-7
Atlanta                                4-5         5-10
Hale                                    4-6          7-11
Fairview                              2-8         4-14
Au Gres-Sims                     1-8         2-15

NORTH STAR LEAGUE-
LITTLE DIPPER
Posen                                 9-1         16-1
Hillman                               9-1         12-6
Atlanta                                4-4           5-9
Hale                                    3-6          6-11
Fairview                              2-8         3-13
Au Gres-Sims                     1-8         2-13

BY: DOM SANTINA 

ELLSWORTH
The East Jordan Boys

basketball team hosted
Ellsworth on Monday, Feb-
ruary 14. The Red Devils
would jump out to a 14-12
lead after the first quarter.
They would end up being
able to stretch their lead to a
4 point lead, as they would
outscore the Lancers 19-17. 

The third quarter would
end up being a big point for
the Red Devils. As they
would be able to stretch the
lead by another 10 points,
outscoring the Lancers 25-
15. The Red Devils would be
able to seal the game with
another strong quarter. The
Red Devils would be able to
take the win 81-62. 

“A great local game that
lived up to a top team in
their conference and divi-
sion and us playing.  We
have to give credit to
Ellsworth as they competed
and fought the whole game.
I was pleased with the effort
and how we played through
some adversity on the night
and took the lead out in the
third quarter.  (Ethan) An-
taya had  a career high,
Devon Olstom had  6 re-
bounds and did a great job
of  keeping them from get-

ting into their offense,” said
Head Coach Nate Dzwik. 

The team would be led by
Ethan Antaya with 25
points. JJ Weber would add
in another 19 points and
Preston Malpass would con-
tribute 16 points. The win
would move the team to 8-7
on the season. The team
would have a quick turn-
around as they would host
Kalkaska on Tuesday, Feb-
ruary 15. 

KALKASKA 
The Red Devils would be

able to earn a slim first
quarter lead as the time
would expire. They would
hold a 15-11 lead heading
into the second quarter. The
Red Devils would put up an-
other 15 points, but the Blaz-
ers would be able to hang

with, as they would only
allow the Red Devils to ex-
pand their lead by 1. The
score would be 30-25 at the
halftime break. 

A big third quarter would
put the Red Devils up for
good. As they would out
score the Blazers 20-12 and
stretch their lead to 13
points. In the fourth quar-
ter, the Red Devils would be
out scored by the Blazers,
but only by 1 point. This
would allow the Red Devils
to secure a 66=54 victory
over the Blazers. 

The team was led by Pre-
ston Malpass with 29 points
and 12 rebounds. Weber and
Antaya would add in 12
points each as well. The win
would move the Red Devils
to 9-7 on the season. While
they would move to 5-6 in
the Lake Michigan Confer-

ence. The team would then
travel to play Grayling on
Friday, February 18. 

GRAYLING
In the previous couple

games, the Red Devils had
got off to good starts. Unfor-
tunately, this time the
Vikings would draw the
early 16-10 first quarter
lead. The Red Devils would
hope for a better second
quarter, but the Vikings
would be able to add an-
other 6 points to their lead.
The Red Devils would find
themselves down 34-22 at
halftime. 

The Red Devils would
have a good third quarter
once again, which would
help them pull back into the
game. As the Red Devils
would cut the Vikings lead

down to 5 by the time the
quarter would end. The
fourth quarter would be the
highest scoring quarter of
the game, but unfortunately
it was also the same for the
Vikings. The Vikings would
be able to expand their lead
back to 8 points. Which
would allow the Vikings to
secure a 67-59 victory over
the Red Devils. 

“We started ok, fought
through a bunch of  foul
trouble and lack of  energy
in the first half. I was really
proud of  the kids’ effort in
the third and fourth quar-
ter. We had the game down
to a bucket a few times but
we couldn’t hit that next
shot or get the next stop.  We
lost our composure in the
second half  and played a
game that isn’t our strong
suit,” said coach Dzwik.  

The Red Devils would be
led by Antaya once again
with 19 points. Preston Mal-
pass would add in another
10 points as well. The loss
moved the Red Devils to 9-8
in the regular season. The
Red Devils would be 5-7 in
the LMC. The Red Devils
will be back in action on
Tuesday, March 1 against
Gaylord. Then they will fin-
ish the regular season on
Thursday, March 3 against
Elk Rapids on the road. 

Red Devils top Ellsworth, Kalkaska, Fall to Grayling

BY: DOM SANTINA 

The Ellsworth Boys Bas-
ketball team would end up
having a tough test to have
for one of  their final regular
season games. The team
would travel to Pickford on
Wednesday, February 23. 

The Lancers would be
able to grab a very slim lead

at the end of  the first quar-
ter, as they would lead 17-16.
The second quarter would
be good for the Lancers as
they would be able to
stretch their lead by 5
points. They would hold a
35-29 lead at the break. 

The third quarter has tra-
ditionally been very good
for the Lancers. This time

however, that would not be
the case. As the Panthers
would have a very solid de-
fensive effort, only allowing
6 points by the Lancers. A 12
point offensive outburst by
the Pioneers would tie the
game up heading to the
fourth quarter. The Lancers
would be able to regroup in
the fourth quarter though.

As they would be able to
outscore the Panthers 17-11
in the quarter to take the
win. 

The scoring for the
Lancers would be very lop-
sided for once for the
Lancers. As Kelan Pletcher
would lead the way with 26
points. Brayden Steenwyk
would have 16 points. Usu-

ally the Lancers would have
3 or 4 players in double fig-
ures, but it would just be
these two this time. The win
moves the Lancers overall
record to 16-3 on the season.
They will wrap up their reg-
ular season with a make-up
game against Boyne Falls
on Tuesday, March 1 at
home. 

Lancers claim hard earned win over Pickford 

LCST makes noise at championship meets

ETHAN ANTAYA PRESTON MALPASS JJ WEBER

BY: DOM SANTINA

The Lake Charlevoix Ski
Team competed in the Lake
Michigan Conference cham-
pionships on Thursday, Feb-
ruary 24. 

The boys team would end
up continuing to show great
improvement and team-
work. Jack Herzog would
end up being the lead skier
for the team with a 5 place
finish in Slalom and 12 in
Giant Slalom and earning
All-Conference honors.
Henry Herzog would have a
problem during his second
run of  SL, which would end

up having him finish 13, he
would finish up GS with a 17
place finish. David Gray
would continue to improve
and find himself  inside the
top 20, with a 19 place in SL.
He would be just outside the
top 20 in GS with a 21 place
finish. 

On the girls side, the team
earned a second place finish
in the LMC. Taylor Stock-
well would end up being the
conference champion in SL,
while finishing in GS, also
taking home all-conference
honors. Ella Doumanian
would end up finishing in 3
for GS and 4 for SL, while
also being named to the all-

conference team. Avery Kita
would have the third fastest
second run, propelling her-
self  to a 14 place finish in GS
and a 9 place finish in SL.
Mya Pfahl would end up
having a 18 place finish in
GS and 17 in SL. While
Kelsey Wiatrolik would fin-
ish in 21 place for GS and
SL. She would be followed
closely by teammate Lily
Brya with 22 place finishes
for both events. 

STATE MEET 
In its first season the Lake

Charlevoix Ski Team had
four members representing

at the State Meet, which was
held at Schuss Mountain. 

Taylor Stockwell, who
came in on the day with
high expectations would end
up battling to come away
with being named second
team all-state. 

Ella Doumanian would
battle through a nagging in-
jury to finish in the top 25 in
both events. 

Avery Kita would end up
earning second team all-
state honors with a 19 place
finish in SL and 16 place in
GS. 

The boys’ team would be
represented by Jack Herzog,
who would have a good day

and finish 15 in SL. He
would be the third member
to earn second team all-state
honors. 

“The future is really excit-
ing for our program.  We
have a group of  great kids
who made this year special.
We will miss the contribu-
tions of  seniors (Lily) Brya
and (Taylor) Stockwell, but
we look forward to future
team growth and success,”
said Head Coach Christo-
pher Herrmann. 

S K I I N G

The Weekly Choice and Charlevoix County
News are locally owned newspapers

We are independently owned newspapers
based in Gaylord, Michigan

Dave Baragrey and the staff of news writ-
ers, sports writers, photographers, graphic
designers, delivery people and sales peo-
ple all live and work here and care about
our local communities we serve.

We hear from readers every week how
much they appreciate all the local cover-
age. We appreciate all the positive re-
sponse from both readers and advertisers
to our newspapers that we hear so fre-
quently.

So many newspapers in the area have
dropped 30% and as much as 50% in cir-
culation over the past year. Our newspaper
distribution has remained steady and in
many towns has grown in circulation.

We of course REALLY appreciate the ad-
vertisers. That is our primary source of
revenue that allows us to publish our pop-
ular newspapers every week covering all
over Northern Michigan.

If you are an advertiser that has become
disappointed with the results of your

newspaper advertising that is costing you
way too much while reaching way fewer
readers, you should try our newspapers.
You will likely pay less money for far more
circulation and reach readers in a much
larger area.

The Weekly Choice is distributed free every
Thursday at almost 600 locations around
Northern Michigan.

The Charlevoix County News is distributed
every Thursday in Boyne City, Boyne Falls,
Charlevoix, East Jordan and Ellsworth to
subscribers and on newsstands and wher-
ever newspapers are sold. Cost is still just
75 cents (not $1.25 or $2.00).

If you want to reach more consumers with
your advertising and pay less money for
advertising, give Dave Baragrey a call or
email. You can even stop into our office
(we still have our office open).

LOCALLY OWNED, LOCALLY OPERATED

LOCAL NEWS, LOCAL SPORTS
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W R E S T L I N G

BY DAVE BARAGREY
Gaylord Blue Devils wrestling team has

been a regular at the state wrestling tourna-
ment year after year. Coach LaJoie and his
staff seem to reload year after year with young
men that work hard with positive results.

This year the Blue Devil wrestling team won
the Regional tournament with a 63 - 18 win
over Petoskey. Then a 34 - 29 win over Bay City
John Glenn to move into the state quarterfi-
nals.

In the Quarterfinals #4 seed Gaylord de-
feated #5 seed Monroe Jefferson by a score of
36 - 35. 

In the Semi-Finals Gaylord met the #1 seed
Lowell. Lowell has won the state champi-
onship in division 2 on numerous occasions.
They beat the Blue Devils by a score of  50 - 6.
Lowell advanced to the finals and won the state
championship by beating Goodrich by a score
of  46 - 16.

This coming weekend six Blue Devils will
compete in the state individual championship.
Advancing to the state tournament after plac-
ing in regionals Gaylord will be represented
by: Ty Bensinger, Brayden Gautreau, Riley
Hush, Louden Stradling, Gabe Thompson and
Gus James.

Petoskey will send two wrestlers to the state
individual tournament, Trevor Swiss and
Brendon Swiss.

In Division 3 Boyne City will send Tim Bow-
man and Jordan McBee to the boys individual
state tournament and Lydia Krauss will com-
pete in the girls individual state tournament.

In Division 4 Charlevoix will send Landon
Swanson and Sam Fry. Mio will send Tyler De-
mory, Brandon Wiltse and Trennen Smith.

Below are the results for the 
Gaylord wrestlers in the 

Division 2 State Team tournament.

103 RESULTS
Sunni LaFond of  Gaylord HS went 0-2
103 - Issac Masserant (Monroe Jefferson HS)

over Sunni LaFond (Gaylord HS) Fall 5:29
103 - Carter Cichocki (Lowell HS) over Sunni

LaFond (Gaylord HS) Maj 15-2

112 RESULTS
Austin Morse of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
112 - Landon Musgrave (Lowell HS) over

Austin Morse (Gaylord HS) Maj 9-0

119 RESULTS
Ethan Eubank of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
119 - Easton Lyons (Lowell HS) over Ethan

Eubank (Gaylord HS) TF 15-0
Austin Morse of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
119 - Ryder Mulherin (Monroe Jefferson HS)

over Austin Morse (Gaylord HS) Fall 4:26

125 RESULTS
Blake Davis of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
125 - Owen Segorski (Lowell HS) over Blake

Davis (Gaylord HS) Fall 0:58
Joey Zaremba of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
125 - John Allen (Monroe Jefferson HS) over

Joey Zaremba (Gaylord HS) TF 19-4

130 RESULTS
Louden Stradling of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
130 - Ramsy Mutschler (Lowell HS) over

Louden Stradling (Gaylord HS) Dec 3-2
130 - Louden Stradling (Gaylord HS) over Ty

Rose (Monroe Jefferson HS) Fall 0:54
135 Results
Gabe Thompson of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
135 - Gabe Thompson (Gaylord HS) over

Dylan Garcia (Monroe Jefferson HS) Fall 3:27
135 - James Link (Lowell HS) over Gabe

Thompson (Gaylord HS) Dec 4-1

140 RESULTS
Gus James of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
140 - Gus James (Gaylord HS) over Caleb

Smiley (Monroe Jefferson HS) Dec 3-1
140 - Landon Miller (Lowell HS) over Gus

James (Gaylord HS) Dec 6-4

145 RESULTS
Drew Anderson of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
145 - Drew Anderson (Gaylord HS) over

Noah White (Monroe Jefferson HS) Dec 10-3
145 - Jared Boone (Lowell HS) over Drew An-

derson (Gaylord HS) Maj 12-0

152 RESULTS
Benny Blyveis of  Gaylord HS went 2-0
152 - Benny Blyveis (Gaylord HS) over Ron-

nie Allen (Monroe Jefferson HS) Fall 1:11
152 - Benny Blyveis (Gaylord HS) over Nate

Cleaver (Lowell HS) Dec 3-1
160 Results
Ty Bensinger of  Gaylord HS went 1-0
160 - Ty Bensinger (Gaylord HS) over Tacho

Gonzales (Lowell HS) Dec 5-1

171 RESULTS
Kaeden Yocum of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
171 - Kaeden Yocum (Gaylord HS) over Seth

Minney (Monroe Jefferson HS) Dec 15-8
171 - Will Neeley (Lowell HS) over Kaeden

Yocum (Gaylord HS) Dec 5-2

189 RESULTS
Riley Hush of  Gaylord HS went 1-1
189 - Riley Hush (Gaylord HS) over Anthony

Cousino (Monroe Jefferson HS) Fall 2:00
189 - Carson Crace (Lowell HS) over Riley

Hush (Gaylord HS) Dec 5-2

215 RESULTS
Brayden Gautreau of  Gaylord HS went 1-0
215 - Brayden Gautreau (Gaylord HS) over

Nathan Masserant (Monroe Jefferson HS) Dec
12-6

Aaron Kassuba of  Gaylord HS went 0-1`
215 - Carter Blough (Lowell HS) over Aaron

Kassuba (Gaylord HS) Fall 1:09

285 RESULTS
Caden Sides of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
285 - Bryson Vandermeulen (Lowell HS) over

Caden Sides (Gaylord HS) Fall 1:49
Aaron Kassuba of  Gaylord HS went 0-1
285 - Freddie Martin (Monroe Jefferson HS)

over Aaron Kassuba (Gaylord HS) Fall 0:25

Gaylord’s Road to the State Finals

AARON KASSUBA PHOTO BY ABE CRUZ

GUS JAMES PHOTO BY ABE CRUZ
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The Associated Press re-
leased its most recent poll of
the high school boys basket-
ball season.

Division 1
1. Detroit King (5) (18-1) 75
2. Orchard Lake St.
Mary‚Äôs (13-4) 67
3. Muskegon (18-1) 64
4. Grand Rapids Northview
(18-1) 63
5. Detroit U-D Jesuit (12-5)
52
6. Detroit Cass Tech (15-3)
49
7. Hamtramck (15-3) 48
8. Bloomfield Hills Brother
Rice (12-6) 36
9. Grand Blanc (13-5) 21
10. Rockford (18-2) 19
Others receiving votes: War-
ren De La Salle 16, Oak
Park 16, East Lansing 14,
Canton 13, Ann Arbor Huron
13, Detroit Western Interna-
tional 9, Grand Haven 9,
River Rouge 9, North Farm-
ington 5, Detroit Catholic
Central 2.

Division 2
1. Williamston (5) (19-0) 75
2. Grand Rapids Catholic
Central (19-1) 70
3. Hudsonville Unity Chris-
tian (19-0) 64
4. Ferndale (14-3) 61
5. Croswell-Lexington (18-0)
55
6. Benton Harbor (16-2) 50
7. Onsted (19-0) 44
8. Parchment (18-1) 38
9. Freeland (19-0) 35
10. Romulus Summit Acad-
emy (16-2) 30
Others receiving votes:
Standish Sterling Central 21,
Marshall 19, Olivet 14, Car-
rollton 11, Warren Lincoln 4,
Grand Rapids Christian 3,
Saginaw 2, Cadillac 2, De-
troit Edison 1, Grand Rapids
West Catholic 1.

Division 3

1. Flint Beecher (5) (17-1)
75
2. Reese (16-2) 68
3. Menominee (17-2) 66
4. Traverse City St. Francis
(16-2) 57
5. Schoolcraft (17-2) 55
6. Riverview Gabriel Richard
(19-0) 49
7. Benzie Central (17-1) 43
8. Detroit Loyola (13-5) 39
9. Bad Axe (17-2) 28
(tie) Mesick (19-0) 28
Others receiving votes: Van-
dercook Lake 22, Grand
Rapids Covenant Christian
16, Pewamo-Westphalia 13,
Montabella 10, Grandville
Calvin Christian 9, Cassopo-
lis Ross Beatty 7, Glen Lake
6, Centreville 4, Erie-Mason
2, Napoleon 2, Elkton-Pi-
geon Bay Port Laker 1.

Division 4
1. Southfield Christian (3)
(14-4) 72
2. McBain Northern Michi-
gan Christian (1) (19-0) 71
3. Hillman (1) (19-0) 62
4. Rudyard (17-1) 60
5. Powers North Central (16-
2) 51
6. New Buffalo (18-1) 47
7. Ewen-Trout Creek (15-3)
37
8. Munising (14-2) 33
9. Wyoming Tri-unity Chris-
tian (12-5) 31
10. Onaway (18-1) 29
Others receiving votes:
Bellevue 23, Genesee
Christian 21, Hillsdale Acad-
emy 19, Lake Leelanau St.
Mary 17, Webberville 10,
Buckley 7, Ubly 4, Colon 2,
Ellsworth 2, Norway 1, De-
troit University Prep Art &
Design 1.

The Michigan Associated
Press released its updated
high school girls basketball
poll of the 2021-22 season.

Division 1
1. West Bloomfield (4) (18-1)
74
2. Hudsonville (1) (18-2) 68
3. Hartland (19-1) 65
4. Midland Dow (18-1) 60
5. Parma Western (19-1) 56
6. Macomb L‚ÄôAnse
Creuse North (19-1) 50
7. Rockford (18-2) 40
8. Wayne Memorial (18-2)
38
9. Byron Center (17-2) 36
10. Farmington Hills Mercy
(16-4) 23
Others receiving votes:
Dearborn Divine Child 18,
Dexter 16, Bloomfield Hills
Marian 15, Battle Creek
Lakeview 14, East Lansing
8, Macomb Dakota 6, How-
ell 4, Grosse Pointe North 3,
South Lyon East 3, Clark-
ston 2, St. Clair Shores
Lakeview 1.

Division 2
1. Detroit Edison (5) (12-3)
75
2. Grand Rapids West
Catholic (19-1) 68
3. Redford Westfield Prep
(18-1) 64
4. Portland (19-1) 59
5. Frankenmuth (18-2) 54
6. Newaygo (19-1) 50
7. Edwardsburg (20-0) 46
8. Lansing Catholic (18-2)
34
9. Ovid-Elsie (19-1) 30
10. Chelsea (17-3) 28
Others receiving votes: Lake
Fenton 16, Ann Arbor
Gabriel Richard 11, Sparta
11, Houghton 9, Romulus 7,
Sault Ste. Marie 7, Imlay
City 6, Tecumseh 6, Otsego
5, Marine City 4, Williamston
4, Harper Woods 2, Clawson
2, Detroit Country Day 1,
Grand Rapids South Chris-

tian 1.

Division 3
1. Ypsilanti Arbor Prepara-
tory (4) (18-2) 74
2. Kent City (20-0) 69
3. Glen Lake (1) (20-0) 67
4. Sandusky (20-0) 57
5. St. Ignace (18-2) 55
6. Schoolcraft (19-1) 48
7. Calumet (17-2) 44
8. Niles Brandywine (18-2)
33
9. Madison Heights Bishop
Foley (15-3) 27
10. Elk Rapids (18-2) 25
(tie) Harbor Springs (19-2)
25
Others receiving votes:
Grass Lake 20, Blooming-
dale 16, Sanford Meridian
12, Brooklyn Columbia Cen-
tral 8, Erie-Mason 6,
Buchanan 5, McBain 4,
Lake City 3, Hart 1, Water-
vliet 1.

Division 4
1. Portland St. Patrick (5)
(19-0) 75
2. Fowler (17-3) 68
3. Athens (19-1) 63
4. Carney-Nadeau (18-1) 58
5. Baraga (18-1) 54
6. Plymouth Christian Acad-
emy (16-4) 53
7. Saginaw Nouvel (16-3) 43
8. Pickford (16-2) 38
9. Posen (14-1) 37
10. Gaylord St. Mary (19-2)
30
Others receiving votes:
Adrian Lenawee Christian
22, Pittsford 15, Mendon 13,
Colon 6, Ewen-Trout Creek
4, Mackinaw City 4, McBain
Northern Michigan Christian
4, Mt. Pleasant Sacred
Heart 3, Ontonagon 3, Lake
Leelanau St. Mary 3, Cole-
man 2, Rudyard 2.

BOYS BASKETBALL 
STATE RANKINGS

GIRLS BASKETBALL 
STATE RANKINGS

Sports

Congratulations to Joshua Robinson on his commitment to play football next year at Hope College! Josh joins his brother Jacob as the only Early College students
at BCHS to move on to compete at the NCAA level.  Josh intends to study Electrical Engineering at Hope.

Joshua Robinson commits to Hope College for Football

C O L L E G E  S I G N I N G S
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News

BY JIM AKANS
Set on a large lot in the Vil-

lage of  Boyne Falls, this two
story home offers plenty of
room to roam both inside and
out.

This four bedroom, three
bath home has approximately
2,303 square feet of  nicely de-
signed and appointed space.
Interior highlights include
wood floors, kitchen with
wood cabinetry and handy
snack bar and lots of  win-

dows throughout that fill the
spaces with natural light.
There is a large main level
laundry/mud room and a
suite with a bedroom and
bath that can be utilized for
visiting family and friends, or
a spot for in-laws. The re-
model of  this home will also
include a pergola entry that
enters the mud room.

Boyne Mountain, offering
year-round recreation with
skiing, golf  plus a waterpark,
dining and entertainment is

close at hand.  This
is a great up north
location.  

This two story, up-
dated home on a
large lot is located at
3056 Mill Street in
Boyne Falls, and it is
listed at $324,900.
For more information or to
arrange a home tour, call
Marty Moody, Associate Bro-
ker or Christopher Chris-
tensen, Associate Broker, at
Lynda’s Real Estate Service

in

Boyne City at 231-582-9555 or
email at Marty@lyndas-
realestateservice.com or
Chris@lyndasrealestateser-
vice.com.

BROUGHT TO YOU BY
HOLLY STARK
EXP REAL ESTATE

R E A L  E S TAT E  C O R N E R

How Much Insulation Do I Have?

R E A L  E S TAT E  F E AT U R E

Look into your attic. We
start with the attic because it
is usually easy to add insula-
tion to an attic. 

Look into your walls. It is
difficult to add insulation to
existing walls unless:

You are planning to add
new siding to your house, or

You plan to finish unfin-
ished space (like a basement
or bonus room).

If  so, you need to know
whether the exterior walls
are already insulated or not.
One method is to use an elec-
trical outlet on the wall, but
first be sure to turn off the
power to the outlet. Then re-
move the cover plate and
shine a flashlight into the
crack around the outlet box.
You should be able to see
whether or not insulation is
in the wall. Also, you should
check separate outlets on the
first and second floor, and in
old and new parts of  the
house, because wall insula-
tion in one wall doesn't neces-
sarily mean that it's
everywhere in the house. An
alternative to checking
through electrical outlets is to
remove and then replace a
small section of  the exterior
siding.

Look under your floors.
Look at the underside of  any
floor over an unheated space
like a garage, basement, or
crawlspace. Inspect and
measure the thickness of  any
insulation you find there. It
will most likely be a fiber-
glass batt, so multiply the
thickness in inches by 3.2 to
find out the R-value (or the R-
value might be visible on a
product label). If  the insula-
tion is a foam board or
sprayed-on foam, use any vis-
ible label information or mul-
tiply the thickness in inches
by 5 to estimate the R-value.

Look at your ductwork.
Don't overlook another area
in your home where energy
can be saved - the ductwork
of  the heating and air condi-
tioning system. If  the ducts of
your heating or air-condition-
ing system run through un-

heated or uncooled spaces in
your home, such as attic or
crawlspaces, then the ducts
should be insulated. First
check the ductwork for air
leaks. Repair leaking joints
first with mechanical fasten-
ers, then seal any remaining
leaks with water-soluble mas-
tic and embedded fiber glass
mesh. Never use gray cloth
duct tape because it degrades,
cracks, and loses its bond
with age. If  a joint has to be
accessible for future mainte-
nance, use pressure- or heat-
sensitive aluminum foil tape.
Then wrap the ducts with
duct wrap insulation of  R-6
with a vapor retarder facing
on the outer side. All joints
where sections of  insulation
meet should have overlapped
facings and be tightly sealed
with fiber glass tape; but
avoid compressing the insula-
tion, thus reducing its thick-
ness and R-value.

Return air ducts are often
located inside the heated por-
tion of  the house where they
don't need to be insulated, but
they should still be sealed off
from air passageways that
connect to unheated areas.
Drywall to ductwork connec-
tions should be inspected be-
cause they are often poor (or
nonexistent) and lead to un-
wanted air flows through wall
cavities. If  the return air
ducts are located in an uncon-
ditioned part of  the building,
they should be insulated.

Look at your pipes. If  water
pipes run through unheated
or uncooled spaces in your
home, such as attic or crawl-
spaces, then the pipes should
be insulated.

Look into your attic. We
start with the attic because it
is usually easy to add insula-
tion to an attic. 

Look into your walls. It is
difficult to add insulation to
existing walls unless:

You are planning to add
new siding to your house, or

You plan to finish unfin-
ished space (like a basement
or bonus room).

In the Rough, Professionally Painted 
or Completely Restored

Over 7,000 sq. ft. of Furniture, Antiques & Goodies

06176 Old U.S. 31 South, Charlevoix, MI 49720

E-Mail: donkellyantiques@yahoo.com

FURNITURE BARN
(231) 547-0133 • Cell (231) 881-0353

Web: dkellyantiques.com

CUSTOM & ANTIQUE
FURNITURE

www.bergmanncenter.org
6585 M-66, Charlevoix MI • 231-547-9624

Bergmann Center Resale Shop

Open Mon-Sat 
10am-5pm

Watch us on
facebook for
our specials!

“Making 
a difference 
in the lives 
we serve”

TWO STORY, UPDATED BOYNE FALLS HOME
OFFERS LOTS OF SPACE INSIDE AND OUT

State Rep. Ken Bor-
ton, who serves on
the House Appropria-
tions Committee,
today announced his
support for a plan to
reduce taxes for
working families and
expand tax savings
for seniors.

House Bill 5838,
which would provide
$1.7 billion in annual
tax relief, today re-
ceived approval from
the House Tax Policy
Committee, during a
joint hearing with the
Appropriations Com-
mittee.

“With inflation sweeping
our nation, the bare necessi-
ties are more expensive
everywhere you look in
Northern Michigan,” said
Borton, R-Gaylord. “Working
families and seniors with lim-
ited income feel this crisis
worse than anyone. Our tax
cut plan will help people
breathe a little easier as they
keep more of  what they’ve
earned.”

HB 5838 would lower Michi-
gan’s individual income tax
rate from 4.25% to 3.9%, re-
ducing the burden on work-
ing and retired families
across Michigan.

In addition to paying a

lower rate, seniors 62 years
and older would be able to ex-
empt $20,000 of  all their in-
come from the state income
tax, or $40,000 for couples fil-
ing jointly. Eligibility for this
exemption currently begins
at age 67. The plan would fur-
ther enable seniors to deduct
retirement income — such as
pensions, 401(k) plans and in-
dividual retirement accounts
— not already included in the
first exemption. This addi-
tional deduction would also
allow up to $20,000 for individ-
ual filers and $40,000 for joint
filers.

HB 5838 now advances to
the entire House of  Represen-
tatives for consideration.

Rep. Borton backs tax relief for
families in Northern Michigan

State Rep. Ken Borton, R-Gaylord, listens during a
joint hearing by the House Appropriations and Tax
Policy committees on Thursday, Feb. 24, at the
state Capitol. The committees considered a plan,
supported by Borton, to reduce taxes for seniors
and working families.

BY MARY FACULAK

EAST JORDAN - We are
seeing “IT” everywhere.
We are reading about
“IT”, talking about “IT”.
What is “IT”??? “IT” is the
lack of  volunteers. “IT” is
not happening in just our
area, “IT” is happening
throughout the country.
Less and less people are
willing to step up and get
involved with a club, or-
ganization, festival, event
or activity. Those individ-
uals that have been
pulling the load, espe-
cially over the last few
years, are burned out and
are stepping down. The
result if  “IT” doesn’t
change....the beloved
events, activities, clubs,
organizations and experi-
ences that we have en-
joyed over the years will
go away. 

Currently in our area
the East Jordan Freedom
Festival and the East Jor-
dan Little League is expe-
riencing “IT”. The current
leadership is stepping
down and no one is step-

ping up. I know there are
several clubs and organi-
zations throughout the
area that are in need of
“new” members or they
could be a victim of  “IT”.
Perhaps now is the time
for some of  these activi-
ties, events, etc. to begin
to make some changes. If
you are one of  those indi-
viduals that feel that way,
get involved and help be a
part of  a positive change
or shift. Sitting on the
sidelines, criticizing (espe-
cially on social media)
saying “you have ideas,
but no time”. (not a good
excuse) will not help “IT”.
All of  the people who have
stepped up and volun-
teered over the years have
worked, had a family and
life issues. They still did
“IT”. They worked “to-
gether” and made a posi-
tive difference in the
community they lived.
They helped contribute to
the quality of  life, helped
grow and supported our
local businesses, they met
new friends, made lasting
memories, enjoyed many
rewarding experiences,

they lived! Volunteering is
great and all ages can par-
ticipate. We all have tal-
ents, experiences and
knowledge to share. It
doesn’t mean you have to
take on an entire project,
event, etc. on your own!
The old adage “Many
hands make less work” is
so true. Being part of  a
collaborative team is ful-
filling and rewarding.
“We” is much better than
“I” when it comes to vol-
unteering. As we move
through this moment,
hopefully every one of  us
will step back, reflect on
what we are doing to help
make a positive difference
in our community. Per-
haps “IT” will start to
change before we totally
lose all that we have en-
joyed in our area.

If  you are not sure how
to get in contact with a
club, organization, etc.
please contact the Cham-
ber for a list of  groups, or-
ganizations, etc. and their
contact information. Per-
haps you attend a few
meetings before deciding
where you would like to

volunteer to be sure it is
the right fit for you. I am
confident that “together”
we can overcome “IT” and
move forward.

Congratulations and
THANK YOU to all of  the
dedicated volunteers who
helped organize and run
the 41st Annual Sno-Blast
Winter Festival. Despite
some intense winter
weather the festival car-
ried on! Congratulations
to all of  our event partici-
pants and winners!
THANK YOU to all of  our
sponsors who helped
make the festival possi-
ble!!! Looking forward to
the 42nd Annual Sno-
Blast Winter Festival. Vol-
unteers and new ideas are
needed to ensure that the
festival continues next
year. Contact Shannon at
the Chamber Office for
more information. Sno-
Blast Committee Mem-
bers - Connie Massey, Don
Massey, Alan Kava, Kelly
Kava, Shannon Fender.

We can Overcome IT



Run for
As Low As Delivered throughout

Charlevoix County Each Week!
$200

CALL: 989.732.8160 EMAIL: office@CharlevoixCountyNews.com ORDER ONLINE: www.CharlevoixCountyNews.com

4 WHEEL DRIVE
2006 Hummer H3. 4x4, leather, tow
pkg, moon roof. Sale Price $7,999.
As low as $249 a month. Rivertown
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd,
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. www.river-
townautosales.com. Need a car a day
or a week. We rent vehicles.
2014 Ford F-150. 4x4, quad cab. Sale
Price $14,999. As low as $349 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.
2015 GMC Yukon SLE. 4WD, rear cam-
era, 3rd row seat, high miles. Sale
Price $21,999. As low as $399 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.

ADVICE FROM GOD
A new command I give you: Love one
another. As I have loved you, so you
must love one another. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS
Are you looking for something more?
God has a plan for you. Encouraging,
Uplifting and Challenging. Join us
Sunday morning at 11am for great
music and ministry and discovering
what the Bible says. Pigeon River
Baptist Church, 2 blocks south of the

blinker in Vanderbilt. If you can’t at-
tend, Watch on Facebook Live Sundays
at 11AM, search Pigeon River Baptist
Church.
DO YOU HAVE SOMETHING NICE TO
SAY? We would like to hear something
nice you have to say about businesses
or people in Northern Michigan. Send
us a note in the mail or by e-mail.
Each week we will publish positive
comments from our readers in the
Weekly Choice, Charlevoix County
News and Michigan MoneySaver. Mail
your note to Weekly Choice, PO Box
382, Gaylord, MI 49734 or e-mail to
Office@WeeklyChoice.com. Negative
notes may be sent elsewhere. 
LOCALLY OWNED, LOCALLY OPERATED,
LOCAL NEWS, LOCAL SPORTS. The
Weekly Choice and Charlevoix County
News and Michigan MoneySaver are
locally owned newspapers. We are
independently owned newspapers
based in Gaylord, Michigan Dave Bara-
grey and the staff of news writers,
sports writers, photographers, graphic
designers, delivery people and sales
people all live and work here and
care about our local communities we
serve. We hear from readers every
week how much they appreciate all
the local coverage. We appreciate all
the positive response from both read-
ers and advertisers to our newspapers
that we hear so frequently. CHOICE
PUBLICATIONS AND MICHIGAN ME-
DIA. Publisher of the Weekly Choice,
Charlevoix County News, Michigan
MoneySaver and APS – Advertisers

Postal Service. 112 East Sixth St., Gay-
lord • Office – 989-732-8160, Cell –
989-350-9235 • Office@Weekly-
Choice.com
LOWEST COST IN MICHIGAN! CLAS-
SIFIED ADS ARE JUST $2 for a 8-word
ad in the Weekly Choice, Charlevoix
County News or Michigan Mon-
eySaver. The area’s widest distribution
paper and the lowest cost for adver-
tising. E-mail your ad to Office@Week-
lyChoice.com or call 989-732-8160.
The Weekly Choice is distributed
weekly from Mackinaw City to
Grayling. 11 zones of the Michigan
MoneySaver distributed from Traverse
City to Tawas City. Northern Michigan’s
best choice for buying and selling.

ANTIQUES & COLLECTIBLES
ANTIQUE Wooden high chair. $75.
Gaylord. 989-350-9235
Oak Antique Craftsman One Drawer
Desk Top File Cabinet. 14.5” wide,
24.5” deep, 13” high. $250 each. 6
available. Buy all 6 for $950. Call 989-
350-9235. Gaylord

APPLIANCES
MAYTAG DRYER, propane can be con-
verted to natural gas. Excellent con-
dition, runs great, $200. Call 989-
705-1601

AUCTIONS
Firearms & Sporting Related Online
Estate Auction Bidding Is Open &
Closes Tue. March 8 This One Owner
Estate Features: (60) Firearms Includ-
ing; Rifles, Shotguns, Hand Guns,
Ammo., Lots Of Military Memorabilia

To Include; Helmets, Officers Hats,
Daggers, Rocket Launcher, Etc.  Lo-
cated: Gladwin. John Peck, Auction-
eers (989) 426-8061. To View A Com-
plete Detailed Listing With Hundreds
Of Photo’s Visit johnpeckauctions.com
Guns & Ammo Auctions 100+ Private
Gun Collection PLUS Bows & Gun Ac-
cessories PLUS Ammo Auction. Bidding
now open through: Guns March 15th,
Ammo March 16th https://estate-
saleexperts.com/ 248-987-0030 ship-
ping available
LIVE AUCTION Saturday, March 12,
at 12 noon. 7200 Partridge Dr Flushing
Mi 48433. 1984 custom El Camino,
huge Lionel train collection, diamond
tennis bracelet, tools, household etc.
ColesAuctionService.com 810-397-
3199.
Yamaha Big Bear 400; Ariens SNO-
TEK snowblower; Huskee 650 series
22-ton log splitter; trailers; appliances;
collectibles; sewing machine; tools,
greenhouse supplies; more! Croff Es-
tate - Bid online at bid.sherwoodauc-
tionservicellc.com. 800-835-0495.

AUTO PARTS
WANTED. TIRE Mounter machine.
Cheap. TEXT 231-262-2071. I SPOKE
TO SOMEONE IN Mancelona a little
while ago that had one. Contact me
again.

AUTOMOBILES
2004 Ford Taurus SES. Only 85K miles,
one owner. Sale Price $3,500. First
come, first served. Rivertown Auto
Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboy-
gan. 231-627-6700. www.rivertow-

nautosales.com. Need a car a day or
a week. We rent vehicles.
2010 Chevy Malibu LS. Only 75K miles.
Sale Price $6,999. As low as $249 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.
2010 Subaru Legacy. AWD. Sale Price
$4,999. As low as $199 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need
a car a day or a week. We rent vehi-
cles.
2013 Buick Verano. Sale Price $5,999.
As low as $199 a month. Rivertown
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd,
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. www.river-
townautosales.com. Need a car a day
or a week. We rent vehicles.
2013 Ford Fusion SE. Leather. Sale
Price $6,450. As low as $219 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need
a car a day or a week. We rent vehi-
cles.
2015 Chevy Malibu LS. Nice car, good
MPG. Sale Price $5,999. As low as
$199 a month. Rivertown Auto Sales
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan.
231-627-6700. www.rivertownautos-
ales.com. Need a car a day or a week.
We rent vehicles.
2017 Dodge Charger. AWD. Very nice.
Sale Price $18,599. As low as $379 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.
I BUY CARS! Wrecked or in need of
mechanical repair, 1995 and up. Gay-
lord area. 989-732-9362
Kia, $500. TEXT 231-262-2071.

BUILDING MATERIALS
METAL ROOFING regular and shingle
style, half off on special colors. Also,
lifetime asphalt shingles available. Li-
censed and insured builders. Quality
work for 40 years. Amish crew. 517-
575-3695.
Replace your roof with the best look-
ing and longest lasting material –
steel from Erie Metal Roofs! Three
styles and multiple colors available.
Guaranteed to last a lifetime! Limited
Time Offer - $500 Discount + Addi-
tional 10% off install (for military,
health workers & 1st responders.)
Call Erie Metal Roofs. 888-718-1856

CLASSIC AUTOS
1993 CAMARO Z-28 Indy Pace Car.
5,948 miles. $20,900. OBO. 231-622-
1553
CASH FOR pre-1970 vehicles. Michel’s
Collision & Restoration 231-622-1553

COMPUTERS
LOCAL ON-SITE or drop off computer
repair. Over 18 Years of Experience.
989-350-3542. www.mwcomputer-
designandservice.com

FIREWOOD & WOODSTOVES
DRY FIREWOOD. Delivered within 30
miles of Boyne and Mancelona. 231-
631-9600. B. Moeke, Boyne City.

FREE ITEMS
FREE WOODEN SKIDS. Most are in
very good shape. Others for kindling.
New supply every week. APS Mini
Warehouse. 112 East Sixth Street,
Gaylord
HAVE SOMETHING TO GIVE AWAY?
Free items classified ads run free of
charge in the Weekly Choice,
Charlevoix County News and the
Michigan MoneySaver. Call 989-732-
8160 or e-mail your ad to
Office@WeeklyChoice.com.

FURNITURE
3 WOODEN Folding chairs. All 3 chairs
for $20. Gaylord. 989-350-9235
4 UPHOLSTERED GAME TABLE CHAIRS.

All 4 chairs for $20. Gaylord. 989-
350-9235
Adjustable Bed Brand New with Im-
comfort gel memory foam mattress.
Retail Cost $3,995, sacrifice for $875..
Call for showing or delivery: 989-615-
2951.
Amish Log Beds, Dressers, Rustic table
and chairs, mattresses for cabin or
home. Lowest price in Michigan!  dan-
danthemattressman.com. 989-923-
1278
“An AMISH LOG HEADBOARD AND
Queen Pillow Top Mattress Set. Brand
new-never used, sell all for $375. Call
anytime 989-923-1278”
Beds-Beds-Beds! Mattresses any size
and any comfort. Delivery anywhere
in Michigan
DanDantheMattressMan.com
Night stand. $2. Gaylord. 989-350-
9235

GUNS
12 GAUGE coach double barrel shot-
gun. Early 1900’s. $300. 231-882-
0440
123 GAUGE PUMP, personal protec-
tion with pistol grip, new in the box,
$275. 231-882-0440
410 Single shot, new in the box, $150.
231-882-0440
BROWNNG BPS 12 gauge pump, in-
vector choke, $525. 231-882-0440
FREE FIREARM APPRAISALS and Con-
signment Sales. Terry’s Gun Shop,
Rose City MI. Buying Winchesters
and 1899 Savages. Call 989-709-1944.
ROSSI 357, lever action, stainless rifle.
$800. 231-882-0440

HEALTH
Aloe Care Health, medical alert system.
The most advanced medical alert
product on the market. Voice-acti-
vated! No Wi-Fi needed! Special offer,
call and mention offer code CARE20
to get $20 off Mobile Companion.
Call today 877-542-1384
DENTAL INSURANCE from Physicians
Mutual Insurance Company. Coverage
for (350+) procedures. Real dental
insurance -Not just a discount plan.
(Don’t wait) Call now! Get your free
Dental Information Kit with all the
details. 877-253-3162
www.dental50plus.com/55 #6258
VIAGRA and CIALIS USERS! 50 Generic
Pills, Special $99. 100% guaranteed.
24/7 Call now. 888-835-7273 Hablam-
os Espanol

HELP WANTED
4 SALES POSITIONS OPEN. PETOSKEY,
CHARLEVOIX COUNTY, WEST
BRANCH/GRAYLING and BENZIE
COUNTY . Independent contractor
position earns 20% commission. If
you are self motivated to get moving
and get in front of local businesses
you can make a ton of money. Most
of our salespeople work from home
and service the businesses close to
home. Businesses love the results
they get from advertising in the
Michigan MoneySaver, Weekly
Choice, Charlevoix County News and
our 13 weekly papers. Our family
owned business if based in Gaylord,
Michigan but we distribute our weekly
papers in 100 towns in 19 counties
in Northern Michigan. I need great
salespeople in various areas in Northern
Michigan. Send your resume to Dave
Baragrey 1. E-mail to Office@Weekly-
Choice.com
ATTENTION EMPLOYERS. Reach across
the state with a Michigan MegaMarket
Statewide Classified Network EM-
PLOYMENT classified ad. Reach 1.9
Million households within highly-read,
local home-delivered newspapers and
shopping guides each week! A 25-
word ad is just $249.00, $10 for ad-
ditional words per-week! Buy 3 ads,
receive each 4th ad FREE! Call 989-
732-8160 today.
GRAYLING - FEATURE STORY WRITER
- Experienced writer and photographer
a plus. Must have Digital camera and
computer. E-mail info and samples
to Dave at Office@WeeklyChoice.com
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EAST JORDAN, BOYNE CITY, 
BOYNE FALLS, CHARLEVOIX

NEWSPAPER WEEKEND DELIVERY
2 ROUTES OPEN.

We have an immediate opening in this area. Home Delivery is primarily
on Saturday or Sunday before Noon. Nice extra income for a few hours of
work. You will need dependable transportation and weekends free. E-mail
Office@MichiganMoneySaver.com or call or text Dave Baragrey at 989-
350-9235. Michigan MoneySaver – APS - Advertisers Postal Service.

Immediate
Openings

ZONING ADMINISTRATOR 
POSITION

Melrose Township, Charlevoix County is accepting
applications for Zoning Administrator. Please send
resume to Melrose Township, P.O. Box 189, Walloon
Lake, MI 49796. Applications are due no later than
March 31. For further information call (231) 535-2310.
Melrose Township Zoning Administrator job description
is defined in Article XIII of the Zoning Ordinance
available at melrosetwp.org.

Job Description:

The Melrose Township Board shall employ a Zoning
Administrator to act as its officer and, except as otherwise
provided in the Ordinance, the Zoning Administrator shall
administer and enforce this Ordinance including the
receiving and processing of applications for zoning
permits, special use permits, sign permits, appeals for
variances and other matters the Zoning Board of Appeals
or Township Planning Commission is required to decide.
The administrator shall also be responsible for the
inspection of premises, the issuance of zoning permits and
institution of proceedings for the enforcement of the
provisions of this Ordinance and other duties as required
by the Township Board that relate to the administration and
enforcement of the Zoning Ordinance.

Zoning Administrator training is required within one year
from date of hiring.

The job is a part time, salaried position without benefits
based on approximately 20 hours per week. Salary is
$24,000 per year with mileage reimbursement at the
current Township rate. Office hours will be required. 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
MARION TOWNSHIP, CHARLEVOIX COUNTY

The Marion Township Zoning Board of Appeals will hold a
public hearing on Tuesday, March 8, 2022 at the Marion
Township Hall located at 3735 Marion Center Road,
Charlevoix, Michigan at 7:00 P.M. for the purpose of receiv-
ing public comment concerning an application by Hagen
Manker on Unit 42 of Pine Bluff Estates for a 15.0 foot front
yard variance from the required 35.0 foot front set-back due
to the severe slope to the rear of said unit.

If you have any questions or concerns or would like addi-
tional information pertaining to this request, you can contact
John Ferguson in writing at 8354 Mercer Road, Charlevoix,
Michigan 49720 or you can call him at 231-547-6218 or
231-459-8141.

CITY OF EAST JORDAN
JOB ANNOUNCEMENT

Elm Pointe Caretaker:  Seasonal position. General
maintenance and caretaking of home, public restrooms,
picnic grounds and beach area.  Open and close park fa-
cilities.  Coordinate rentals with City Hall. Assist Parks Di-
rector as needed.

Pay Scale: $4,000

Requirements:  Must have excellent public relation skills.
Applicant must be able to operate and maintain lawn
equipment and have general "handy person" skills.  The
City prefers a "live on site" caretaker.

Position Available:  April through October 2022

Application Forms:  Available from City Hall, 201 Main
Street, East Jordan.  Or submit resume' to City of East
Jordan, Elm Pointe Caretaker Position, C/O City Clerk, 
PO Box 499, East Jordan, MI 49727 or to cwilson@
eastjordancity.org. Applications will be accepted until 
the position is filled.

The City of East Jordan is an equal opportunity employer.

CITY OF EAST JORDAN
HELP WANTED

The City of East Jordan is accepting applications for 
Harbor Dock Attendants, Parks Maintenance, Tourist Park
Maintenance, Tourist Park Office Attendants, and Part
Time DPW (with potential to go full time in the future).  
Applications are available at www.eastjordancity.org or
send a resume and application to: City of East Jordan, 
PO Box 499, C/O City Clerk, East Jordan, MI 49727 or
email to cwilson@eastjordancity.org.  A copy of these job
descriptions are available on our website or at City Hall.
The City is an Equal Opportunity Employer.

The East Jordan Planning Commission will hold a public
hearing on Thursday, March 10, 2022, at 5:30 p.m. to 
hear any comments or concerns regarding the following

proposed zoning ordinance amendment:
� Amend Chapter 46 Zoning, Article I In General, 

Amend Article I, Section 46-8 Definitions
� Amend Chapter 46 Zoning, Article III Division 9, C1 
Local Commercial District, Amend Section 46-445

� Amend Chapter 46 Zoning, Article V, Special Uses, 
Amend Article V to add new Section 46-798 Regulations 

for variety stores and small box stores
The Public Hearing will be held at City Hall, 
201 Main Street, East Jordan, MI, 49727. 

Any written comments may be addressed to 
City of East Jordan, C/O City Clerk, 
PO BOX 499, East Jordan, MI 49727.

PUBLIC HEARING
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HELP WANTED
FEATURE STORY WRITER. Writing ex-
perience preferred. The Weekly
Choice, a Locally owned “Positive
News” weekly paper is distributed
all around Northern Michigan includ-
ing Gaylord, Petoskey, Cheboygan,
Grayling, Indian River, Mackinaw City,
Onaway, Lewiston, Mio, Mancelona,
Kalkaska and everywhere in between.
Freelance writer will supply articles
and photos. $35 per story plus $10
for photo(s). Email Resume Dave Bara-
grey. Office@WeeklyChoice.com
Forest Dunes Golf Club in Roscommon
is hosting job fairs - March 10 (3-5p),
March 12 (10a-2p), March 15 (5-7p)
and March 16 (4-6p). We are hiring
for many full and part time seasonal
positions. Positions include house-
keeping, greenskeepers, equipment
operators, servers, cooks, bartenders,
rangers, starters, front desk. Early
morning and weekend availability re-
quired for most positions. Visit forest-
dunesgolf.com/jobs. 989-275-0700.
PETOSKEY - FEATURE STORY WRITER
- Experienced writer and photographer
a plus. Must have Digital camera and
computer. E-mail info and samples
to Dave at Office@WeeklyChoice.com
We have an immediate opening in
this area. Home Delivery is primarily
on Saturday or Sunday before Noon.
Nice extra income for a few hours of
work. You will need dependable trans-
portation and weekends free. E-mail
Office@MichiganMoneySaver.com or
call or text Dave Baragrey at 989-
350-9235. Michigan MoneySaver –
APS - Advertisers Postal Service.

LAND & PROPERTY
NICE WOODED 1.25 acre parcel on
Kettle Lake Rd. just outside of the
Village limits, No Village Tax. Survey
showing 3 lots which can be split.
Walk to town yet very private. Call
Rollene at Bayside Real Estate. 231-
557-1140. $45,000.

MISCELLANEOUS
BATH & SHOWER UPDATES in as little
as ONE DAY! Affordable prices. No
payments for 18 months. Lifetime
warranty & professional installs. Senior
& Military Discounts available. Call
877-401-2404
DIRECTV for $69.99/mo for 12 months
with CHOICE Package. Watch your
favorite live sports, news & enter-
tainment anywhere. One year of HBO
Max FREE.  Directv is #1 in Customer
Satisfaction (JD Power & Assoc.) Call
for more details! (some restrictions
apply) Call 888-351-0154

DISCOUNT AIR TRAVEL. Call Flight
Services for best pricing on domestic
& international flights inside and from
the US. Serving United, Delta, Amer-
ican & Southwest and many more
airlines. Call for free quote now! Have
travel dates ready! 866-314-9880
DISH Network. $64.99 for 190 Chan-
nels. Blazing Fast Internet,
$19.99/mo. (where available.)
Switch & get a free $100 Visa gift
card. Free voice remote. Free HD
DVR. Free streaming on all devices.
Call today. 866-950-6757
Eliminate gutter cleaning forever!
LeafFilter, the most advanced de-
bris-blocking gutter protection.
Schedule a FREE LeafFilter estimate
today. 15% off Entire Purchase. 10%
Senior & Military Discounts. Call
844-369-2501
GENERAC Standby Generators provide
backup power during utility power
outages, so your home and family
stay safe and comfortable. Prepare
now. Free 7-year extended warranty
($695 value!). Request a free quote
today. Call for additional terms and
conditions. 833-363-1981.
LEATHER JACKET, like new, black, XL.
Paid $300. Asking $125 obo. 231-
529-8462.
Looking for assisted living, memory
care, or independent living? A Place
for Mom simplifies the process of
finding senior living at no cost to
your family. Call 888-978-0584 to-
day!
LOWEST COST IN MICHIGAN! CLAS-
SIFIED ADS ARE JUST $2 for a 8-word
ad in the Weekly Choice, Charlevoix
County News or Michigan Mon-
eySaver. The area’s widest distribution
paper and the lowest cost for adver-
tising. E-mail your ad to Office@Week-
lyChoice.com or call 989-732-8160.
The Weekly Choice is distributed
weekly from Mackinaw City to
Grayling. 11 zones of the Michigan
MoneySaver distributed from Traverse
City to Tawas City. Northern Michigan’s
best choice for buying and selling.
Reach Across Michigan with a Mega-
Market Statewide Classified Ad! Over
1.2 million weekly circulation just
$249 per week! Buy 3 Get 1 Free!
Call this paper, 989-732-8160.
The Generac PWRcell, a solar plus
battery storage system. SAVE money,
reduce your reliance on the grid, pre-
pare for power outages and power
your home. Full installation services
available. $0 Down Financing Option.
Request a FREE, no obligation, quote
today. Call 855-476-9698
Wesley Financial Group, LLC Timeshare
Cancellation Experts. Over

$50,000,000 in timeshare debt and
fees cancelled in 2019. Get free in-
formational package and learn how
to get rid of your timeshare! Free
consultations. Over 450 positive re-
views. Call 855-473-7811

NOTES OF ENCOURAGEMENT
Positive Notes of Encouragement are
free in the Weekly Choice, Charlevoix
County News and Michigan Mon-
eySaver. Birthday, Anniversary, Wed-
ding, Congratulations or just a Positive
Note all are free. E-Mail your Note of
Encouragement to Office@Weekly-
Choice.com

PETS
COCKER SPANIEL PUPPIES. Good col-
ors. Taking deposits. Shots, wormed,
vet checked. 989-426-3866, 989-965-
4278. Karen
FIVE PUPPIES, 3 males, 2 females.
Black German Shepherd father, Moth-
er, black & white border collie. $350
each. 989-619-2572
Gracie’s Dog Grooming. Private in
home grooming 231-350-6580. E-mail
Graciesgrooming2022@gmail.com. So-
cial media @GraciesDoggrooming.
Affordable prices with quality work 
SHIH-POO PUPPIES. Also Toy Yorkie
Puppies. Shots, wormed, vet checked.
989-426-3866, 989-965-4278. Karen

RECREATIONAL VEHICLES
2008 FOREST RIVER CARDINAL LE. 33
foot fifth wheel, 3 slideouts, $14,000.
231-587-9018 or 231-642-0577

SERVICES
CHAD VLASSIS PAINTING. Serving
Northern Michigan since 2012. 989-
390-5730

STORAGE
APS Mini-Warehouse of Gaylord has
5x10 units for just $39 a month. No
long term contract necessary. In town,
safe storage. Larger units may also
available. Call 989-732-8160.

NEW STORAGE UNITS available at
Meyer Ace Hardware, corner of McCoy
Road and Old 27 South Gaylord.
12x30. Call David, 989-732-1394.

SUV
2010 Chevy Traverse LTZ. Leather,
Moon roof, 3rd row seat. Good miles,
Sale Price $6,999. As low as $249 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.
2011 GMC Terrain. 126 K miles. Sale
Price $3,999. As low as $199 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need
a car a day or a week. We rent vehi-
cles.
2013 Ford Explorer. 3rd row seat,
tow pkg, leather. Sale Price $11,599.
As low as $299 a month. Rivertown
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd,
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. www.river-
townautosales.com. Need a car a day
or a week. We rent vehicles.
2013 Lincoln Navigator. 4WD, rear
camera, leather, 3rd row seat. Nice
SUV. Only 130K miles. Sale Price
$17,999. As low as $349 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need
a car a day or a week. We rent vehi-
cles.
2015 Ford Edge SEL. Very nice. Sale
Price $15,999. As low as $349 a
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & Leas-
ing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. www.rivertownautosales.com.
Need a car a day or a week. We rent
vehicles.

TRACTORS
2011 COYOTE TRACTOR LK 30, 316
hours, comes with disk, rear blade,
front blade, forks and cultivator,
$14,000. 231-587-9018 or 231-642-
0577

TRUCKS
2014 Ram 1/2 ton. 4x4, spray-in bed-
liner, extended cab. 2 to choose from.
Call for price. Rivertown Auto Sales
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan.
231-627-6700. www.rivertownautos-
ales.com. Need a car a day or a week.
We rent vehicles.
2015 GMC Sierra. Double cab, bed-
liner, tow pkg. Sale Price $22,999. As
low as $419 a month. Rivertown Auto
Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboy-
gan. 231-627-6700. www.rivertow-
nautosales.com. Need a car a day or
a week. We rent vehicles.
2020 Ford F-150 XLT. 4x4, quad cab,
rear camera. 68K miles. Sale Price
$28,900. As low as $479 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need a
car a day or a week. We rent vehicles.

VANS
2006 Buick Terraza. Braun Entervan

with wheelchair lift. Sale Price $5,999.
As low as $249 a month. Rivertown
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd,
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. www.river-
townautosales.com. Need a car a day
or a week. We rent vehicles.
2015 Ram C/V Cargo van. Sale Price
$6,799. As low as $239 a month.
Rivertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 989
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700.
www.rivertownautosales.com. Need
a car a day or a week. We rent vehi-
cles.

WANTED
TOP CASH PAID for old guitars. 1920-
1980 Gibson, Martin, Fender, Gretsch,
Epiphone, Guild, Mosrite, Ricken-
backer, Prairie State, D’Angelico,
Stromberg and Gibson Mandolins,
Banjos. 844-904-2336
Wanted: OUTBOARD MOTORS, any
size, running or not. Also selling Out-
board Motors. Call 989-619-2303

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
SOUTH ARM TOWNSHIP, CHARLEVOIX COUNTY

The South Arm Township Planning Commission will hold a
public hearing on Thursday, March 3, 2022 at 7:00 P.M. at
the South Arm Township Hall located at 02811 South M-66
Highway, East Jordan, Michigan for the purpose of receiving
public comment pertaining to an application by Thomas
Stolt requesting a special use permit allowing him to con-
duct marina operations and services that include washing,
winterization, maintenance and other services on site at
6353 Dutchman Bay Road which is commercial use. Mr.
Stolt received a prior special use permit for construction of
two large pole buildings to be used for winter storage of
boats and boat trailers only.
If you have any questions or concerns or would like addi-
tional information pertaining to this request, you can contact
John Ferguson, Zoning Administrator in writing at 8354 Mer-
cer Road, Charlevoix, Michigan 49720 or by phone at 231-
547-6218 or 231-459-8141.

Run for
As Low As Delivered throughout

Charlevoix County Each Week!
$200

CALL: 989.732.8160 EMAIL: office@CharlevoixCountyNews.com ORDER ONLINE: www.CharlevoixCountyNews.com

Invitation to Bid
Ellsworth Community School is accepting bids for the 

construction of a pavilion and paved walking trail around
the playground at Ellsworth Elementary School. 

Contact Superintendent, Aaron Gaffney at 231-588-2544
or agaffney@ellsworth.k12.mi.us for more information. 

Bids accepted through Friday, March 11.

The Boyne City Housing Commission is currently
accepting applications for the following waiting
lists: Public Housing (Litzenburger Place Apts. and
Family Housing), Section 8 Housing Choice
Voucher, and Deer Meadows Apts. Applications
can be obtained at 829 S. Park St., Boyne City, MI
49712 or by calling 231-582-6203. Applications
can also be downloaded at boynehousingcommis-
sion.org. Equal Housing Opportunity.
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Tuesday, November 16 • 9AM TO 5:30PM
Wednesday, November 17 • 9AM TO 5:30PM
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LADLOG
WE BUY GOLD

ITEMS REGARDLESS 
OF CONDITION

High School Rings .......... up to
$150

Old Rings .......................................... up to
$150

Chains $200

1/4 car

1/2 car

1 carat

T

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      01hcraM,y,adsruhT

ENEMGAG ENDNOMIA DLL
 carat...................................... up to

$150 2 carat......................

 carat .........................up to
$1,000 3 carat ......................

at................................ up to 
$4,000 5 carat ...................u

y
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ERVSILS GIN RTEN

• Bullion
• Silver Jewel
• Flatware Se
• Tea Set
• Antique Ite

........ up to 
$12,000

....up to
$20,000

up to 
$100,000

0
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Chains ..................................................up to 200
Old Watch ........................up to

$1,000
Bracelets................................ up to

$1,500
Necklaces ............................ up to 

$1,500
CASH 10%

FR

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

ROINE10% S

FREE EVALUAT
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SRALLO D
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q

During the past few years
nterest rates, war and unce
tock market perform
ombined to push prices of

and silver t to their highest
n 25 years. We have studie
nvestment and retail marke
decades, and in the past d
imes of economic uncert
which is deepening
here have been dramatic

declines in many areas of jew
gold, and retail markets.  W
s why this may be the best
n decades for you to sell for
of the highest prices ever.

he following Rare Dolla
Used New

.......... up to $2,000 ..................$50,00

IMPORTAN
ECONOMIC

INFORMATIO

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

Dental .............................................

Broken Chains ................
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 COIN!RVE SILONE
0 FOR $90,00

D BUYER PAI

!SNIOCDL
ROF000 DIAPAREYUB

 only.old  G.Bring in coupon

LAICEP SROINES

ECIR PTSEHGI HDEETNARAUG
VER  OREASEINC

%
 only.old  G.Bring in coupon

RICET PIGHESH
TEEDNRAAGU

R EV OESAERCNI

ERVSILS INO CERVSIL

in
st
co
a
in
in
d
ti
(w
th
d
g
is
in
of

e Gold:
New

$10,000
$17,500
$5,000
$10,000
$50,000
$10,000

We Pay up to for the follo
 United States

1794 to 1803 .....................................

IT’S FAST & EASY
UR TRAINED PROFESSIONALS USE THE

LATEST HIGH TECH EQUIPMENT

10% 20

WILL PAY UP TO

1200%
ON SILVER COINS WITH 

FACE VALUE OF 1964 OR OLDER.

P

ONE
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DLOG
      We      We Pay up to for t

 United States
$1.00 1842 to 1889 ...........
$2.50 1798 to 1834 ............
$2.50 1840 to 1929 ..........
$3.00 1854 to 1888 ............
$5.00 1795 to 1833 ............
$5.00 1834 to 1838

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

OG81
,62S INO CD

r the following Rare Gold:
Used

....................up to $1,000 ................ $10,

....................up to $5,500 ................ $17,5

....................up to $1,000 ................ $5,

....................up to $3,000 ............... $10,

....................up to $10,000 ............ $50

....................up to $1,000 ................ $10,000

....................up to $1,500 ................. $6,000

....................up to $1,500 ................. $6,000

....................up to $9,000 ............... $29,000

....................up to $1,000 ................ $7,500

....................up to $1,500 ................. $10,000

....................up to $5,000 ............... $15,000

....................up to $7,500 ................ $25,000

REASOER BRINGING

$
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1. Midwest Gold Buyers
new and antique jew
qualify us to evaluate

2. Midwest Gold Buyers
work in compliance wit

3. This is an ideal opp
evaluated (especially i
here in this area.  Co
offer.  No appointmen

4. If you are not wearing o

We have surprised many people who thought items were
not valuable enough to consider.  The expert evaluators we
have gathered together offfer you a wealth of knowledge and
experience.  We are accustomed to paying thousands of dollars
for valuable items.  Don’t miss this opportunity.  Perhaps we’ll

5.00 1834 to 1838 ............
$5.00 1839 to 1908 ..........
$5.00 1908 to 1929 ..........

$10.00 1795 to 1804...........
$10.00 1839 to 1932 ...........

$20.00 1850 to 1933...........
$50.00 1851 to 1852 .............
$50.00 1915 Pan-Pec .....

SCONSIDER BRINGING
EVERYTHING

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

ONS TO SELL

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

1794 p $2, $50,00
1836 to 1838 ................................................. up to $1,000 ....................$5,000
1840 to 1873 ................................................ up to $500 ........................$5,000
Trade Dollars ......................................... up to $100 ..........................$2,50
1878 to 1904 ................................................ up to $1,500 .....................$12,50
1921 to 1935  ................................................. up to $50 .............................$5,000

All prices in ad based on rarity and conditio

YOU MAY HAVE $1,000’S 
WORTH GATHERING DU
Almost everyone has something of value they no lon

style, watches that are old or e
broken, silver pieces.  Several it
that might be useless to YOU ma
considered treasures by the collec
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 rarity and condition.

’S 
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 specializes in evaluation and buying
welry. Our generations of experience
e everything from small pieces to the

 has an undisputed reputation.  We
e with your local and state government.

portunity to have your valuables
f you inherited them) by expertts right
me in for a free appraisal and cash

ment necessary.
g or enjoying the items you have, then
 for you to convertt them to cash.  This
 just holding hard to sell diamonds,

S T  SELL

cons
from

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

There’s never a charge for c

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

7 E M42

 never a charge for consultation or services.

  

 

 

 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 
 

 
 

   
 
 

   
  

  
   
  

  
  

  
   

  
    

   

     
   
   

  

   
  

      

    
 
 

  
  

  
  

 

   
   

 
  

  

 
  

  

  

 
  

 
  

  

   

  

 

 

 

   

 
 

   
    

  

 

 

  

 

     

   
  

   
  

   
    

 

 
 

 

      
      

    
      

      
      

this is a great chance f
is much better than
jewelry, & coins.
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